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""*|HE following Addrels has been 
presented to his Majesty by Captain 
Edward Stanhope : Which Ad­
dress his Majesty was pleased to re­

ceive very gracioufly. 

T o the King's most Excellent Majesty, 

-The humble Addresi of the Justices of the 
•Peace, Grand Jury, Gentlemen, and Free­
holders, assembled at the General Quarter 
Sessions ofthe Peace ofthe West Riding of 
the County of York, held at Pontefract the 
13d Day of April, in thfe Seventh Year of 
your Majesty's Reign. 

"VI7E your Majesty's loyal Subjects, the Ju-
* v ftices of the Peace, Grand Jury, Gen­

tlemen, and Freeholders, aflembled at the 
laid General Quarter Seffions, beg Leave 
humbly to congratulate your Majesty on Oc­
casion of the late happy Marriage between her 
Highness the Princess Royal and his Serene 
Highnels the Prince of Orange; a Name 
which breathes Englilh Liberty and Property, 
and every thing dear to all true Englishmen, 
and true Protestants • Titles which had been 
long before now extinct, had it not been fbr 
this Prince's great and glorious Ancestor, 
that Ppince of Orange, from whom we ori­
ginally derive ail the present Bleffings of this 
Nation, and the greatest ofall, your Majesty,, 
"find the Power we t***p)w have of thanking your 
Majesty for, all the Hopes and Fears whkh 
ariie from this Marriage : For what is it that 
the Cause of true Protestantism may not 
hope ? What is it that its Enemies may not 
fear from this happy Union, and from -that 
Perpetuity it promises to our present Happi 
ness. 

As your Majesty does every thing in the 
Power of Majesty and Goodnesi to perpetu­
ate our Happinesi, we in Return cannot hut 
do every thiqg in the Power of Loyalty and 
Gratitude to perpetuate your Majesty's ; an<J 
will make it -oar Business to convince all 
Men, that this our Gratitude does not con-
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silt only ih Words, but in Activity, and iri 
doing all we can to chuse and send such Re­
presentatives to Parliament, as are not likely 
to give up those civil and feligious Liberties 
of Englishmen, which your Majesty by this 
and all the Steps of your Royai Conduct* 
does all you can to preserve to your Ma­
jesty's most dutiful and loyal Subjects. 

The following Addresi of the Mayor, AU 
dermen, Sheriff, aqd the rest of the Com­
mon Council of the Town of Newcastle up-« 
on Tyne, has been presented to his Majesty 
by Matthew Fetherstone Haugh, Esq; one of 
the Aldermen of the said Town: Which Ad­
dresi his Majesty was pleased to receive very 
graciously; 

T o the King's most Excellent Majesty, 

The humble Address of the Mayof, Alder* 
men, Sheriff, and the rest of the Common 
Council of the Town of Newcastle upon 
Tyne, in the County of the Town of 
Newcastle upon Tyne, in Common Coun­
cil aflembleda 

May it please your Mdjesiy, 
1 1 / E your most dutiful and loyal Subjects* 
' ' do humbly beg Leave to present thi** 

our congratulatory_Addrefs to your sacred 
Majesty, upon the Marriage of the Princesi 
Royal with his most Serene Highnesi the 
Prince of Orange, which Alliance ieerns to 
have been universally desired by your Maje­
sty'* Subjects, and the Accomplishment the**re-» 
of hath given the most general Satisfaction. 

Our former Alliances with that tnost jllq-
strious House have always been attended 
with very great Advantages to our Nation* 
and have pfoved a very great Support to the 
Prote:stant Interest* 

'It is frefli in our Mepwries, an-d pughe 
never to be forgotten what that great aqd 
glorious Pjince' King YVilliain the Third, 
did for the English Nation, who not only 
rescued and delivered ttyese Kingdoms from 
the most imminent Dangers, bus secured our 
most valuable flights and Liberties to us iii 
{fdki a 'Manner, that the -many inei"Jin*! able-

Blessing* 


