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State

Warrants Under the Royal Sign
Manual
Her Majesty The QUEEN has been graciously pleased by Warrant under
Her Royal Signet and Sign Manual bearing date 9 May 2012 to ordain
and declare that Emma Joy, wife of Julian Alexander Baron Fellowes
of West Stafford, and niece of the late Henry Herbert Earl Kitchener
of Khartoum and Broome, shall henceforth have, hold and enjoy the
same title, rank, place, pre-eminence and precedence as a daughter of
an Earl as would have been due to her had her late father Charles
Eaton Kitchener (commonly called The Honourable Charles Eaton
Kitchener) survived his brother the said Henry Herbert Earl Kitchener
of Khartoum and Broome, and thereby succeeded to the title and
dignity of Earl Kitchener of Khartoum and Broome. And to command
that the said Royal Concession and Declaration be recorded in Her
Majesty’s College of Arms.

G A Bavister (1596529)

Ecclesiastical

Marriage Acts
A building certified for worship named CHRISTIAN LIFE CENTRE
CHURCH, The Regal, 300 Cowley Road, Cowley, Oxford in the
registration district of Oxfordshire, in the Non-Metropolitan County
of Oxfordshire, was on 23 April 2012, registered for solemnising
marriages therein, pursuant to section 41 of the Marriage Act 1949,
as amended by section 1(1) of the Marriage Acts Amendment Act
1958. In lieu of Christian Life Centre Church, 49 Cowley Road,
Oxford, now disused and the registration cancelled thereof.

Superintendent Registrar

27 April 2012. (1596498)


