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determining the manner in which the books, accounts and
documents of the Company and of the Liquidator shall be disposed
of.
(283) A. J. Armitage, Liquidator

HOWSON (PROJECT SERVICES) LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that a General Meeting of the Members and a
Meeting of Creditors of Howson (Project Services) Limited will be
held at Park House, Park Square West, Leeds LSI 2PS, on Friday,
26th August 1994 at 12 noon and 12.15 p.m. respectively, for the
purpose of having an account laid before them by the Liquidator
(pursuant to section 595 of the Companies Act 1986) showing the
manner in which the winding-up of the said Company has been
conducted, and the property of the Company disposed of, and of
hearing any explanation that may be given by the Liquidator, and
also of determining the manner in which the books, accounts and
documents of the Company and of the Liquidator shall be disposed
of.
(282) A. J. Armitage. Liquidator

H. HAMBLIN ELECTRICAL ENGINEERS &
CONTRACTORS LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that a Final Meeting of the Members and of
the Creditors of H. Hamblin Electrical Engineers & Contractors
Limited will be held at Winchester House, Corporation Street,
Taunton, Somerset TA1 4AJ, on llth August 1994, at 10 a.m. and
10.30 a.m. respectively, for the purpose of having an account laid
before them by the Liquidator, pursuant to section 106 of the
Insolvency Act 1986, showing the manner in which the winding-up
of the said Company has been conducted, and the property of the
Company disposed of, and of hearing any explanation that may be
given by the Liquidator. A Member or Creditor entitled to attend
and vote at either of the above Meetings may appoint a proxy to
attend and vote in his place. It is not necessary for the proxyholder
to be a Member or Creditor. Proxy forms must be returned to the
above address by no later than 4 p.m. on 9th August 1994.

S. J. Misted, Liquidator
7th July 1994. (602)

In the Derby County Court. No. 21 of 1990

FILIGREE TEXTILES LIMITED
(Now known as Green Baine Limited)

A Final Meeting of Creditors of the above-named Company has
been summoned by the Liquidator under section 146 of the
Insolvency Act 1986, for the purpose of receiving the Liquidator's
report on the winding-up and all other matters to be determined
under section 174 of the Insolvency Act 1986. The Meeting will be
held at 11.30 a.m., on Tuesday, 9th August 1994, at Touche Ross &
Co., 1 Woodborough Road, Nottingham NG1 3FG.

/. Wilson, Liquidator
24th June 1994. (281)

DUBARRY CLEANERS LTD.

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 106 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a General Meeting of the Members and a Meeting of the
Creditors of Dubarry Cleaners Ltd., will be held at 36-40 North
Parade, Bradford, on Wednesday, 10th August 1994, at 11.15 a.m.
and 11.30 a.m. respectively, for the purpose of having an account
laid before them and to receive the report of the Liquidator showing
the manner in which the winding-up of the said Company has been
conducted and the property of the Company disposed of and of
hearing any explanation that may be given by the Liquidator. A
Member entitled to attend and vote at the above Meeting of
Members is entitled to appoint a proxy to attend and vote instead of
him. A proxy need not be a Member.

L. R. Hall, Liquidator
12th July 1994. (280)

FEATHERLIGHT LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 106 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a General Meeting of the Members and a Meeting of
Creditors of the above-named Company will be held at Kidsons
Impey, Fulcrum House, 7 The Norwich Business Park, Whiting

Road, Norwich Norfolk NR4 6DJ, on Tuesday, 23rd August 1994,
at 2.15 p.m. and 2.30 p.m. respectively for the purpose of having an
account laid before them, showing how the winding-up of the
Company has been conducted and the property of the Company
disposed of, and of hearing any explanation that may be given by the
Liquidator, and also of directing the manner in which the books,
accounts and documents of the Company and of the Liquidator
thereof, shall be disposed of. A Member entitled to attend and vote
at the Meeting of Members may appoint a proxy to attend and vote
instead of him. A proxy may not be a Member of the Company.

/. A. Norton, Liquidator
12th July 1994. (279)

In the High Court of Justice. No. 2454 of 1989

K & N ELECTRONICS LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that a Final General Meeting of the Creditors
of the above-named Company pursuant to section 146 of the
Insolvency Act 1986, will be held at 10.30 a.m., on 10th August 1994,
at 4-8 Tabernacle Street, London EC2A 4LU..

/. C. Heath, Liquidator
13th July 1994. (278)

ANGLO GLASSADEN LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that a Final Meeting of the Members and of
the Creditors of Anglo Glassaden Limited, pursuant to section 106
of the Insolvency Act 1986, will be held at the offices of Revell Ward
Morton, Airedale House, 77 Albion Street, Leeds LSI 5HT, on
Thursday, 18th August 1994, at 10 a.m. and 10.30 a.m. respectively,
for the purpose of having an account laid before them by the
Liquidator, showing the manner in which the winding-up of the said
Company has been conducted, and the property of the Company
disposed of, and of hearing any explanation that may be given by the
Liquidator. A Member or Creditor entitled to attend and vote at the
above Meetings may appoint a proxy to attend and vote in his place.
It is not necessary for the proxy to be a Member or Creditor.

M. Field, Liquidator
7th July 1994. (603)

R S FABRICATORS (DARLINGTON) LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that a General Meeting of the Members and a
Meeting of Creditors of R S Fabricators (Darlington) Limited will
be held at Park House, Park Square West, Leeds LSI 2PS, on
Wednesday, 31st August 1994, at 10 a.m. and 10.15 a.m.
respectively, for the purpose of having an account laid before them
by the Liquidator (pursuant to section 595 of the Companies Act
1985) showing the manner in which the winding-up of the said
Company has been conducted, and the property of the Company
disposed of, and of hearing any explanation that may be given by the
Liquidator, and also of determining the manner in which the books,
accounts and documents of the Company and of the Liquidator shall
be disposed of. A Member entitled to attend and vote at the above
Meeting of Members is entitled to appoint a proxy to attend and vote
instead of him. A proxy need not be a Member.
(286) A. J. Armitage, Liquidator

WRAYSBURY FOUNDRY LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 106 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a General Meeting of the Members and Creditors of the
above-named Company will be held at 1 Moor Park Road,
Northwood, Middlesex, on 10th August 1994, at 12.30 p.m. and
12.45 p.m. respectively, for the purpose of having an account laid
before them showing the manner in which the winding-up has been
conducted and the property of the Company disposed of, and of
hearing any explanation that may be given by the Liquidator, and of
passing an Extraordinary Resolution directing the manner in which
the books and documents of the Company, and of the Liquidator
shall be disposed of. A Member or Creditor entitled to attend and
vote may appoint a proxy, who need not also be a Member or
Creditor of the Company, to attend and vote instead of him. Proxies
for use at the Meeting must be lodged not later than 4 p.m. of the
business day before the Meeting.
(287) R. Lubell, Liquidator


