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GANTCROSS LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at 91 New Cavendish Street, London W1M 8HL, on
Thursday, 14th July 1994, at 11.30 a.m., for the purposes mentioned
in sections 99 to 101 of the Insolvency Act 1986. A list of the names
and addresses of the Company's Creditors may be inspected, free of
charge, at the offices of Sterling Ford, 91 New Cavendish Street,
London W1M 8HL, from 10 a.m. on Tuesday, 12th July 1994.

By Order of the Board.
J. Cleary, Director

30th June 1994. (172)

TANGENT DIRECT MARKETING COMPANY LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at 33 St. George's Drive, London SW1V 4DG, on 21st
July 1994, at 12 noon, for the purposes mentioned in sections 99 to
101 of the said Act. Creditors wishing to vote at the Meeting must
lodge their proxy, together with a full statement of account at the
registered office 33 St. George's Drive, London, SW1V 4DG, not
later than 12 noon, on 20th July 1994. For the purposes of voting, a
secured Creditor is required (unless he surrenders his security), to
lodge at 33 St. George's Drive, London, SW1V 4DG, before the
Meeting a statement giving particulars of his security, the date when
it was given, and the value at which it is assessed. Notice is further
given that a list of the names and addresses of the Company's
Creditors may be inspected, free of charge, at 33 St. George's Drive,
London, SW1V 4DG, between 10 a.m. and 4 p.m. on the two
business days preceding the date of the Meeting stated above.
Proxies to be used at the Meeting must be lodged at the registered
office of the Company at 33 St. George's Drive, London, SW1V
4DG, not later than 12 noon on 20th July 1994.

By Order of the Board.
(177) D. Falconer, Director

S J F CONSTRUCTION LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Rogers Evans, 20 Brunswick Place, Southampton
SOI 5 2AQ, on 20th July 1994, at 2.30 p.m., for the purposes
mentioned in sections 99 to 101 of the said Act. Creditors should
lodge particulars of their claims for voting purposes at Rogers
Evans, 20 Brunswick Place, Southampton SO1S 2AQ, before the
Meeting. Secured Creditors (unless they surrender their security)
should also include a statement giving details of their security, the
date on which it was given and the value at which it is assessed. Any
Creditor entitled to attend and vote at this Meeting is entitled to do
so either in person or by proxy. Completed proxy forms must be
lodged at Rogers Evans, 20 Brunswick Place, Southampton SO1S
2AQ, by 12 noon on 19th July 1994. A list of the names and addresses
of the Company's Creditors will be available for inspection, free of
charge, at Rogers Evans, 20 Brunswick Place, Southampton SOI 5
2AQ, on the two working days prior to the Meeting.

S. Fox, Director
1st July 1994. (166)

P & F PACKAGING LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that a Meeting of the Creditors in the above
matter is to be held at Harpenden Moat House Hotel, Southdown
Road, Harpenden, Hertfordshire on 18th July 1994, at 11 a.m., to
consider my proposals under section 23(1) of the Insolvency Act
1986 and to consider establishing a Creditors' Committee. In order
to be entitled to vote at the Meeting you must give to me, not later
than 12 noon on the business day before the day fixed for the
Meeting, details in writing of your claim.
(165) V. 5. Judd, Administrator

TELEBRAND GROUP LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Booth White, Trafalgar House, 8-10 Nelson Street,
Southend-on-Sea, Essex SSI 1EF, on 19th July 1994, at 12 noon for
the purposes mentioned in sections 100 and 101 et seq of the said Act.

Brian Mills, Licensed Insolvency Practitioner, of Booth White, 2
Nelson Street, Southend-on-Sea, Essex SSI 1EF, will furnish
Creditors, free of charge, with such information concerning the
Company's affairs as they may reasonably require.

By Order of the Board.
J. Baxter, Director

27th June 1994. (157)

BRIDGWATER GLASS COMPANY LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Newland Mallett Garner Woodbury & Co., Crown
House, 37-41 Prince Street, Bristol BS1 4PS, on Friday, 15th July
1994, at 3 p.m., for the purposes provided for in sections 99,100 and
101. A list of the names and addresses of the Creditors will be
available for inspection at the offices of Newland Mallett Garner
Woodbury & Co., Crown House, 37-41 Prince Street, Bristol BS1
4PS, during normal office hours on the two business days
immediately prior to the date of the Meeting.

NOTE. For the purposes of voting, a statement of claim and any
proxy intended to be used at the Meeting must be lodged at the
registered office of the Company at Crown House, 37-41 Prince
Street, Bristol BS14PS, not later than 12 noon on 14th July 1994.

By Order of the Board.
J. M. Hills, Secretary

17th June 1994. (156)

F. W. RIDGE & SONS LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at The Borough Arms Hotel, King Street, Newcastle,
Staffordshire ST51HX, on Thursday, 14th July 1994, at 10.30a.m.,
for the purpose of having a full statement of the position of the
Company's affairs, together with a list of the Creditors of the
Company and the estimated amount of their claims, laid before
them, and for the purpose, if thought fit, of nominating a Liquidator
and of appointing a Liquidation Committee. On the two business
days falling next before the day on which the Meeting is to be held, a
list of the names and addresses of the Company's Creditors will be
available for inspection, free of charge, at Lawrence James,
Enterprise House, Moorland Road, Burslem, Stoke-on-Trent ST6
1QR, being a place in the relevant locality. Notice is also given that,
for the purpose of voting, Secured Creditors must (unless they
surrender their security), lodge at the Registered Office of the
Company at Lawrence James, Enterprise House, Moorland Road,
Burslem, Stoke-on-Trent ST6 1QR, before the Meeting a statement
giving particulars of their security, the date when it was given, and
the value at which it is assessed.

By Order of the Board
C. H. Ridge. Director

29th June 1994. (242)

EUROPLASTICS (NORTHERN) LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Wesley House, Huddersfield Road, Birstall, Batley,
West Yorkshire, on Friday, 15th July 1994, at 11.30 a.m., for the
purpose of dealing with sections 99 to 101 of the Insolvency Act
1986. A full list of the names and addresses of the Company's
Creditors may be examined, free of charge, at the offices of O'Hara &
Co., Wesley House, Huddersfield Road, Birstall, Batley WF17 OEJ,
between 10 a.m. and 5 p.m. on the two business days prior to the date
of this Meeting.

By Order of the Board.
S. Tolladay, Director

28th June 1994. (503)

SOFTWARE CLEARANCE (UK) LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Abbey House, 74 Mosley Street, Manchester M60
2AT, on 18th July 1994, at 12.30 p.m., for the purposes mentioned in
sections 99 to 101 of the Insolvency Act 1986. N. J. Dargan, of
Touche Ross & Co., Abbey House, 74 Mosley Street, Manchester


