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they surrender their security, secured Creditors must give particulars
of their security and its value if they wish to vote at the Meeting.

By Order of the Board.

D. A. Phillips, Director
19th November 1992. (278)

PROLA LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at 89-95 New Town Row, Birmingham B6 4HG, on
Wednesday, 2nd December 1992, at 11 a.m., for the purpose of
having a full statement of the position of the Company's affairs,
together with a list of the Creditors of the Company and the
estimated amount of their claims, laid before them, and for the
purpose, if thought fit, of nominating a Liquidator and of
appointing a Liquidation Committee. M. D. Alexander and S.
Hoffman, of Lewis Alexander & Collins, 103 Portland Street,
Manchester Ml 6DF, are persons qualified to act as Insolvency
Practitioners in relation to the Company who will, during the period
before the day of the Meeting, furnish Creditors, free of charge, with
such information concerning the Company's affairs as they may
reasonably require. For the purpose of voting, secured Creditors
must (unless they surrender their security), lodge at the registered
office of the Company at Lewis Alexander & Collins, 103 Portland
Street, Manchester Ml 6DF, before the Meeting a statement giving
particulars of their security, the date when it was given, and the value
at which it is assessed.

By Order of the Board.
B. Frost, Director

9th November 1992. (277)

WIVELSFffiLD GREEN GARAGES LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at The Birch Hotel, Lewes Road, Haywards Heath,
Sussex RH17 7SF, at 12 noon, on Wednesday, 2nd December 1992,
for the purposes mentioned in sections 99 to 101 of the said Act, that
is to consider the directors' statement of affairs, to appoint a
Liquidation Committee. Any Creditor wishing to vote at the
Meeting must lodge a completed proof of debt form (together, if it is
desired to vote by proxy, with a completed proxy form) at the offices
of George T. Ehlers, North End Farm, Ditchling, Sussex BN6 8TG,
not later than 12 noon, on 1st December 1992. A list of the names
and addresses of the Company's Creditors will be available for
inspection, free of charge, at the offices of George T. Ehlers, North
End Farm, Ditchling, Sussex BN6 8TG, on 30th November 1992.

By Order of the Board.
M. W. Simms, Director

14th November 1992. (306)

QBF LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at The Post House Hotel, Egerton Road, Guildford,
Surrey, on Thursday, 3rd December 1992, at 11.30 a.m., for the
purposes provided for in sections 99 to 101 of the said Act. For the
purposes of voting, proof of debt and proxy forms intended to be
used at the Meeting must be lodged at the registered office of the
Company, now situated at the offices of Turpin, Barker &
Armstrong, Brittingham House, Orchard Street, Crawley, West
Sussex RH117AE, no later than 12 noon, on the business day before.
Notice is also hereby given, pursuant to section 98(2)(a) of the
Insolvency Act 1986, that Martin Charles Armstrong of Turpin
Barker & Armstrong, Brittingham House, Orchard Street, Crawley,
West Sussex RH11 7AE, is qualified to act as an Insolvency
Practitioner in relation to the above Company and will, during the
period before the day of the Meeting, furnish Creditors with such
information concerning the Company's affairs as they may
reasonably require.

/. Lane, Director

SPENCER KIRKWOOD FINE ART FRAMES LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at 243 Caledonian Road, London Nl 1ED, on Tuesday,
1st December 1992, at 4 p.m., for the purposes mentioned in section
100 and 101 of the said Act. For the purposes mentioned in section
98(2) Andrew C. Panayi, of Andrew & Co., 243 Caledonian Road,
London Nl 1ED, will provide the relevant information.

By Order of the Board.
B. J. Kent, Director

18th November 1992. (406)

COMETSTYLE LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Pannell House, 1S9 Charles Street, Leicester, on 23rd
November 1992, at 11 a.m., for the purposes mentioned in section 99
to 101 of the said Act. Creditors wishing to vote at the Meeting must
lodge their proxy, together with a full statement of account at the
registered office, Pannell House, 159 Charles Street, Leicester LEI
1LD, not later than 12 noon, on 22nd November 1992. For the
purposes of voting, a secured Creditor is required (unless he
surrenders his security) to lodge at Pannell House, 159 Charles
Street, Leicester LEI 1LD, before the Meeting, a statement giving
particulars of his security, the date when it was given and the value
at which it is assessed. Notice is further given that a list of the names
and addresses of the Company's Creditors may be inspected, free of
charge, at Pannell House, 159 Charles Street, Leicester LEI 1LD,
beween 10 a.m. and 4 p.m., on the two business days preceding the
date of the Meeting stated above. The Company has no connection
with Shades Of Croft or Cleavers Caberet.

By Order of the Board.
(399) R. W. Cleaver, Director

HASTINGWOOD CONSTRUCTION LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at the offices of Kallis & Co., at 176 High Road, East
Finchley, London N2 9AS, on 3rd December 1992, at 10.30 a.m. for
the purposes mentioned in sections 100 and 101 of the said Act, that
is, the nomination of a Liquidator and the appointment of a
Liquidation Committee. Proxy forms to be used for the purposes of
the above Meeting must be lodged, accompanied by statements of
claim, at the registered office of the Company, situated at 176 High
Road, East Finchley, London N2 9AS, not later than 12 noon on
2nd December 1992. Pursuant to section 98(2)(a) of the Insolvency
Act 1986, Kikis Kallis, of 176 High Road, East Finchley, London
N2 9AS, is qualified to act as an Insolvency Practitioner in relation
to the above Company and will furnish Creditors free of charge with
such information concerning the above Company's affairs as they
may reasonably require.

By Order of the Board.
B. E. Cook, Director

17th November 1992. (458)

HASTINGWOOD MANAGEMENT LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at the offices of Kallis & Co., at 176 High Road, East
Finchley, London N2 9AS, on 3rd December 1992, at 10 a.m. for the
proposes mentioned in sections 100 and 101 of the said Act, that
is, the nomination of a Liquidator and the appointment of a
Liquidation Committee. Proxy forms to be used for the purposes of
the above Meeting must be lodged, accompanied by statements of
claim, at the registered office of the Company, situated at 176 High
Road, East Finchley, London N2 9AS, not later than 12 noon on
2nd December 1992. Pursuant to section 98(2Xa) of the Insolvency
Act 1986, Kikis Kallis, of 176 High Road, East Finchley, London
N2 9AS, is qualified to act as an Insolvency Practitioner in relation
to the above Company and will furnish Creditors free of charge with
such information concerning the above Company's affairs as they
may reasonably require.

By Order of the Board.
B. E. Cook, Director

19th November 1992. (447) 17th November 1992. (397)


