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Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

For the Purpose of formulating claims, Creditors should note that
the date of sequestration was 21st August 1992 (date of Court Order
granting warrant to cite).
(160) G. Ritchie, Interim Trustee

The Estate of MARTIN BOYD, of 159 Irish Street, Dumfries, was
sequestrated by the Sheriff at Dumfries, on 24th September 1992,
and Andrew Messham Kennedy, 6 Atholl Crescent, Perth, has been
appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the sequestrated
Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim hi the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the Purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration was 1st September 1992.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.
(282) D. M. Kennedy, Interim Trustee

The Estate of DEREK DAVID MURDOCH, residing at c/o 47
Newhouse Drive, Kilbirnie KA2S 6EP, was sequestrated by the
Sheriff of North Strathclyde at Kilmarnock on 7th October 1992,
and J. C. J. Readman, George House, 50 George Square, Glasgow
G21RR, has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee
on the sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
account or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration is 16th September 1992.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

J. C. J. Readman, Interim Trustee
J 3th October 1992. (165)

The Estate of MARIA ANNE MATTHEWS or MURDOCH,
residing at 47 Newhouse Drive, Kilbiraie KA25 6EP, was
sequestrated by the Sheriff of North Strathclyde at Kilmarnock, on
7th October 1992, and J. C. J. Readman, George House, 50 George
Square, Glasgow G21RR, has been appointed by the Court to act
as Interim Trustee on the sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
account or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration is 16th September 1992.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

/. C. J. Readman, Interim Trustee
13th October 1992. (166)

The Estate of GERALD B. ATTKEN, residing at 103 Lodoun
Street, Mauchline, Ayrshire, was sequestrated by the Sheriff of
South Strathclyde, Dumfries and Galloway at Ayr, on 6th October
1992, and J. C. J. Readman, George House, 50 George Square,
Glasgow G21RR, has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim
Trustee on the sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
account or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration is 4th September 1992.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

/. C. J. Readman, Interim Trustee
12th October 1992. (167)

The Estate of ANNE TURNBULL, residing at 39 Burnpark Road,
Shortlees, Kilmarnock KA14SF, was sequestrated by the Sheriff of
North Strathclyde at Kilmarnock, on 23rd September 1992, and
J. C. J. Readman, George House, 50 George Square, Glasgow G2
1RR, has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on
the sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
account or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration is 2nd September 1992.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

J. C. J. Readman, Interim Trustee
12th October 1992. (168)

The Estate of FIONA SNEDDEN, residing at 18 Mingle Place,
Boness EH51 9HX, was sequestrated by the Sheriff of Tayside
Central and Fife at Falkirk on 23rd September 1992, and J. C. J.
Readman, George House, 50 George Square, Glasgow G21RR, has
been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the
sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
account or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration is 26th August 1992.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

/. C /. Readman, Interim Trustee
12th October 1992. (169)

The Estate of GARRY DANIEL, formerly residing at 14 Brosdale
Court, Hallglen, Falkirk, and now at c/o 26 RougUands Crescent,
Carronshore, Falkirk, was sequestrated by the Sheriff of Tayside
Central & Fife at Falkirk, on 23rd September 1992, and J. C. J.
Readman, George House, 50 George Square, Glasgow G21RR, has
been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the
sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration is 20th August 1992.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

/. C /. Readman, Interim Trustee
12th October 1992. (170)

The Estate of JOSEPH LEAHY, residing at 8 Cplinton Place,
Springboig, Glasgow, was sequestrated by the Sheriff of Glasgow
and Strathkelvin at Glasgow, on 2nd October 1992, and I. C. I.
Readman, George House, 50 George Square, Glasgow G21RR, has
been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the
sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration is 14th September 1992.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

/ C J. Readman. Interim Trustee
12th October 1992. (171)

The Estate of LISA JANE SCOTT, residing at 39 Baberton Mains
Drive, Edinburgh, was sequestrated by the Sheriff at Edinburgh, on
5th October 1992, and John Dickson Laurie, Erskine House, 68-73
Queen Street, Edinburgh EH2 4NH, has been appointed by the
Court to act as Interim Trustee on the sequestrated Estate.


