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Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purposes of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration was 1st July 1991.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

P. J. Campbell, Interim Trustee
12th September 1991. (473)

The Estate of BRENT ANDREW KERR, residing at 27 Taylor
Place, Dalkeith, Midlothian, was sequestrated by the Sheriff at
Edinburgh on 4th September 1991 and Peter James Cranbourne
Taylor, Erskine House, 68-73 Queen Street, Edinburgh EH2 4NH,
has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the
sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purposes of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration was 2nd August 1991.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

P. C. Taylor, Interim Trustee
13th September 1991. . (475)

The following notice is in substitution for that which appeared on page
13797 of the London Gazette dated 10th September 1991:

The Estate of JANICE MAXWELL (formerly MHAIRI
STEWART), residing at c/o Inglis, 201 Hollybrook Street,
Govanhill, Glasgow, was sequestrated by the Sheriff at Glasgow on
28th August 1991 and Frank Blin, Cork Gully, Kintyre House, 209
West George Street, Glasgow G2 2LW, has been appointed by the
Court to act as Interim Trustee on the sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
sequestration was 21st May 1991.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

F. Blin, Interim Trustee
3rd September 1991.


