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DUNRAVEN DEVELOPMENT LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that the Creditors of the above-named
Company are required on or before 16th June 1988 to send in
their names and addresses, with particulars of their Debts or
Claims, and the names and addresses of their Solicitors (if any),
to the undersigned of Anthony Peter McQueen Benedict,
Benedict McQueen & Co., 5 Mulgrave Court, Mulgrave Road,
Sutton, Surrey SM2 6LF the Liquidator of the said Company,
and, if so required by notice in writing by the said Liquidator,
are by their Solicitors or perspnally to come in and prove their
said Debts 9r Claims at such time and place as shall be specified
in such notice, or in default thereof they will be excluded from
the benefit of any distriubtion made before such debts are
proved.

NOTE: This notice is purely formal and all known Creditors
have been, or will be, paid in full.

A. P. M. Benedict, Liquidator
16th March 1988. (926)

HUNTERCOMBE LANE LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that the Creditors of the above-named
Company are required on or before 16th June 1988 to send in
their names and addresses, with particulars of their debts or
claims, and the names and addresses of their Solicitors (if any),
to the undersigned Anthony Peter McQueen Benedict, of
Benedict McQueen & Co., 5 Mulgrave Court, Mulgrave Road,
Sutton, Surrey SM2 6LF the Liquidator of the said Company,
and, if so required by notice in writing by the said Liquidator are
by their Solicitors or personally to come in and prove their said
debts or claims at such time and place as shall be specified in
such notice, or in default thereof they will be excluded from the
benefit of any distribution made before such debts are proved.

NOTE: This notice is purely formal and all known Creditors
have been, or will be, paid in full.

A. P. M. Benedict, Liquidator
16th March 1988. (930)

DUNRAVEN HOLDINGS LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that the Creditors of the above-named
Company are required on or before 16th June 1988 to send in
their names and addresses, with particulars of their Debts or
Claims, and the names and addresses of their Solicitors (if any),
to the undersigned of Anthony Peter McQueen Benedict,
Benedict McQueen & Co., 5 Mulgrave Court, Mulgrave Road,
Sutton, Surrey SM2 6LF the Liquidator of the said Company,
and, if so required by notice in writing by the said Liquidator,
are by their Solicitors or personally to come in and prove their
said Debts or Claims at such time and place as shall be specified
in such notice, or in default thereof they will be excluded from
the benefit of any distriubtion made before such debts are
proved.

NOTE: This notice is purely formal and all known Creditors
have been, or will be, paid in full.

A. P. M. Benedict, Liquidator
16th March 1988. (927)

BEACON FELT ROOFING COMPANY LIMITED

Notice is also hereby given that the Creditors of the above-
named Company are required on or before 6th May 1988 to
send their names and addresses, and particulars of their debts or
claims and the names and addresses of their Solicitor (if any) to:
Frank Arthur Simms, Insol House, 39 Station Road,
Lutterworth, Leicestershire LEI7 4AP, the Liquidator of the
said Company; and, if so required by notice in writing from the
said Liquidator, and, by their Solicitors or personally, to come
in and prove their said debts or claims at such time and place as
shall be specified in such notices, or in default thereof they will
be excluded from the benefit of any distribution made before
such debts are proved.

F. A. Simms, Liquidator
21st March 1988. (931)

DUNRAVEN HOLDINGS (MANAGEMENT) LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that the Creditors of the above-named
Company are required on or before 16th June 1988 to send in
their names and addresses, with particulars of their Debts or
Claims, and the names and addresses of their Solicitors (if any),
to the undersigned of Anthony Peter McQueen Benedict,
Benedict McQueen & Co., S Mulgrave Court, Mulgrave Road,
Sutton, Surrey SM2 6LF the Liquidator of the said Company,
and, if so required by notice in writing by the said Liquidator,
are by their Solicitors or personally to come in and prove their
said Debts or Claims at such time and place as shall be specified
in such notice, or in default thereof they will be excluded from
the benefit of any distriubtion made before such debts are
proved.

NOTE: This notice is purely formal and all known Creditors
have been, or will be, paid in full.

A. P. M. Benedict, Liquidator
16th March 1988. (928)

VL SECURITIES TRADING LIMITED

On 23rd March 1988, the above-named Company was placed in
Members' voluntary Liquidation and Dipanker Mohan Ghosh
and Jonathan Guy Anthony Phillips of Price Waterhouse, No. 1
London Bridge, London SE1 9QL were appointed Joint
Liquidators by the Members.

The Liquidators give notice pursuant ot Rule 4.182A of the
Insolvency Rules 1986 that the Creditors of the above Company
must send details in writing, of any claim against the Company
to the Liquidators, at the above address by 20th April 1988. The
Liquidators also give notice under the provision of Rule 4.182A
(6) that on 27th April 1988, they intend to make a final return
to Creditors who have submitted claims by 20th April 1988, and
that there will be no further distribution to Creditors.

The Company is able to pay all known Creditors in full.
D. M. Ghosh, Joint Liquidator

23rd March 1988. (948)

L. G. DEVELOPMENT LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that the Creditors of the above-named
Company are required on or before 16th June 1988 to send in
their names and addresses, with particulars of their debts or
claims, and the names and addresses of their Solicitors (if any),
to the undersigned Anthony Peter McQueen Benedict, of
Benedict McQueen & Co., S Mulgrave Court, Mulgrave Road,
Sutton, Surrey SM2 6LF the Liquidator of the said Company,
and, if so required by notice in writing by the said Liquidator are
by their Solicitors or personally to come in and prove their said
debts or claims at such time and place as shall be specified in
such notice, or in default thereof they will be excluded from the
benefit of any distribution made before such debts are proved.

NOTE: This n9tice is purely formal and all known Creditors
have been, or will be, paid in full.

A. P. M. Benedict, Liquidator
16th March 1988. (929)

VENTURE LINK (HOLDINGS) LIMITED

On 23rd March 1988, the above-named Company was placed in
Members' voluntary Liquidation and Dipanker Mohan Ghosh
and Jonathan Guy Anthony Phillips of Pnce Waterhouse, No. 1
London Bridge, London SE1 9QL were appointed Joint
Liquidators by the Members.

The Liquidators give notice pursuant ot Rule 4.182A of the
Insolvency Rules 1986 that the Creditors of the above Company
must send details in writing, of any claim against the Company
to the Liquidators, at the above address by 20th April 1988. The
Liquidators also give notice under the provision of Rule 4.182A
(6) that on 27th April 1988, they intend to make a final return
to Creditors who have submitted claims by 20th April 1988, and
that there will be no further distribution to Creditors.

The Company is able to pay all known Creditors in full.
D. M. Ghosh, Joint Liquidator

23rd March 1988. (949)


