
THE LONDON GAZETTE, 25 MARCH, 1947 1401

Any local or other public authority company or
person desiring to bring before the Ministry of Fuel
and Power any objection to the draft Order may do
so by registered letter addressed to the Minister of
Fuel and Power, 7, Millbank, London, S.W.i, and
despatched on or before the 26th day of April,
1947.

Any such objection shall state: —
(a) the specific grounds of objection, and
(6) the omissions, additions or modifications

asked for.
A copy of the objection must be forwarded to the

undermentioned Town Clerk or Parliamentary Agents
at the same time as it is sent to the Minister.

Copies of the draft Order and of an Ordnance Map
on a scale of one inch to the mile showing the situa-
tion of the proposed and the existing gas works of
the Corporation and the boundaries of the existing
area of supply and of an Ordnance Map on a scale
of twenty-five inches to the. mile showing the land
proposed to be used for the construction of gas works
have been deposited for public inspection at the
offices of the Clerk of the. Council of the Adminis-
trative County of the North Riding of Yorkshire
at Northallerton and of the Town Clerk of Middles-
brough at the Municipal Buildings, Middlesbrough,
and printed copies of the draft Order may be
obtained at the offices of the undersigned at the
price of one shilling for each copy.

Dated this 25th day of March, 1947.
E. C. PARR, Town Clerk, Municipal Buildings,

Middlesbrough.
LEWIN GREGORY TORR DURNFORD and

CO., 2, Millbank House, Westminster, S.W.i,
Parliamentary Agents.

(160) J

STAMFORD AND SAINT MARTIN STAMFORD
BARON GAS ACT, 1892.

NOTICE is hereby given that the Stamford and
Saint Martin Stamford Baron Gas Light and Coke
Company (hereinafter called " the Company ")
whose offices are situate at Whari Road Stamford
in the County of Lincoln, intend to make application
to the Minister of Fuel and Power for an Order
under section i of the Gas Undertakings Act 1929
authorising the Company for the purposes of their
undertaking to raise further capital (in addition to
the sum of £10,000 which the Company is authorised
to raise under and by virtue of the power in that
behalf conferred by section 22 of the above Act)
not exceeding in the aggregate (including any
premiums payable in respect thereof) the sum of
£12,000 and to borrow on mortgage of the Com-
pany's undertaking or by the creation and issue of
Debenture Stock any sum which together with any
outstanding loans shall not exceed the aggregate
amount of the paid up share capital of the Company
for the time being and of any premiums paid in
respect therof and that such Order shall contain such
modifications of the Stamford and Saint Martin
Stamford Baron Gas Act 1892 as are contained in
the Schedule hereto and as shall in the opinion of
the Minister be necessary in order to give full effect
to the Order.

Any local or other public authority company or
person desiring to bring before the Minister any
objection to the application may do so by registered
letter addressed to the Minister of Fuel and Power
at 7, Millbank, London, S.W.i, and despatched on
or before the 2ist day of April, 1947. Any such
objection shall state the specific grounds of objection,
and a copy of the objection shall be forwarded to
the Company at Wharf Road, Stamford, Lines, or
to the Solicitors Messrs. Phillips Evans & Dalton,
Stamford, Lines, at the same time as the original
is despatched to the Minister.

THE SCHEDULE ABOVE REFERRED TO.
Section of the Act

affected. Modifications Required.
Section 18. The words " On the passing of this

Act" shall be deleted and for the
words " twenty-five thousand seven
•hundred and fifty pounds " there
shall be substituted the words
" Thirty-seven thousand seven
hundred and fifty pounds" and
for the words " ten thousand
pounds " there shall be substituted
the words " twenty-two thousand
pounds ".

Section 22. For the words " ten thousand
pounds " wherever they occur
there shall be substituted the words
" twenty-two thousand pounds ".

Section 35. After the word " undertaking " there
shall be inserted the words "or by
the creation and issue subject to
the provisions of section thirty-nine
of this Act of debenture stock ".
For the words " three thousand
nine hundred and thirty-seven
pounds " there shall be substituted
the words " fifteen thousand seven
hundred and fifty pounds ".

Section 36. After the word " undertaking"
there shall be inserted the words
"or by the creation and issue sub-
ject to the provisions of section:
thirty-nine of this Act of debenture-
stock."
There shall be deleted the words-
" one-fourth part of ".

Dated the 22nd day of March, 1947.

PHILLIPS EVANS and DALTON, i, Barn Hill,.
(121) Stamford, Lines, Solicitors to the Company..

SUTTON COLDFIELD RECTORY ESTATES.

SALE BY THE ECCLESIASTICAL COMMISSIONERS FOR
ENGLAND TO THE CORPORATION OF SUTTON COLDFIELD.

IN pursuance of section 8 of the Sutton Coldfield
Rectory Act 1907 (7 Edw. 7 Cap. XL) the Ecclesias-
tical Commissioners for England hereby give notice
that by an Instrument under their Common Seal
dated the 24th day of February 1947 and made
between the said Ecclesiastical Commissioners of the
one part and the Mayor Aldermen and Burgesses of
the Borough of Sutton Coldfield of the other part
the said Ecclesiastical Commissioners conveyed unto
the said Mayor Aldermen and Burgesses of the
Borough of Sutton Coldfield certain freehold land
situate on the North East side of Coleshill Road in
the Parish of Sutton Coldfield in the County of
Warwick and containing la. 3r. 32p. or thereabouts.

MILLES DAY and CO., 5, Little College Street,
Westminster, S.W.i, Solicitors to the

(155) Ecclesiastical Commissioners for England.

STATEMENT showing the QUANTITIES SOLD and
AVERAGE PRICES of BRITISH CORN per cwt. of
112 Imperial lb.* as received by the MINISTRY
OF AGRICULTURE AND FISHERIES in the week ended
22nd March, 1947, pursuant to the Corn Returns
Act, 1882, the Corn Sales Act, 1921, and the
Agriculture (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1943.

British Corn.

WHEAT
BARLEY
OATS

Quantities sold.

cwt.
266,157
209,515
37.129

Average Price
per cwt.

s. d.
15 &
22 IO
17 7

* Section 8 of the Corn Returns Act, 1882, as
amended by Section 2 of the Corn Sales Act, 1921,
provides that, in the weekly summary of quantities
and prices each sort of British Corn shall be com-
puted with reference to the cwt. of 112 Imperial
Standard lb.

NOTE.—The prices in the statement above are
based on returns received during the week ended
22nd March, 1947, and represent on the whole the
average prices ruling in the week ended i5th
March, 1947.

H. T. WILLIAMS.

Ministry of Agriculture and Fisheries,
Princeton House,

271, High Holborn, London, W.C.I.


