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ARTICLE 4.

The present Convention shall be ratified. The
ratifications shall be exchanged .at London as
soon as possible.

ARTICLE 5.
The present Convention shall enter into force

three months after the exchange of ratifications,
and shall have the same duration as the Extra-
dition Treaty of the sist March, 1873. .

In faith whereof the above-named plenipoten-
tiaries have signed the present Convention and
have affixed thereto their seals.

Done in duplicate in English and Icelandic
at London.the 25th day of October 1938.

(L.S.) HALIFAX.
(L.S.) E. REVENTLOW.

And whereas the ratifications of the said
supplementary Convention were exchanged at
London on the I5th day of June, 1939:

.And whereas His Majesty has ratified the said
supplementary convention in respect of, and
the said Convention thereby extends to, the
United Kingdom of Great Britain and Northern
Ireland, the Channel Islands, the Isle of Man,
Newfoundland, and British Colonies:

Now, therefore, His Majesty, by and with
the advice of His Privy Council, and in virtue
of the authority committed to Him by the said
recited Acts, doth order, ' and it is hereby,
ordered, that from and after the I5th day of
September, 1939, the said Acts shall apply in
.respect of the. United Kingdom of Great Britain
and Northern Ireland, the Channel Islands, the
Isle of Man> Newfoundland, and British
Colonies in the case of Iceland under and in
accordance with.the said Treaty of the 3ist
March, 1873, as modified by the supplementary
Convention of the 25th October, 1938.

This Order may be cited as the Iceland
(Extradition) Order in Council, 1939.

Rupert B. Howorth.

At the Court at Buckingham Palace, the
25th day of July, 1939.

PRESENT,
The KING'S Most Excellent Majesty in Council.

WHEREAS the Ecclesiastical Commissioners
for England have, in pursuance of the Act of
the 59th year of His late Majesty King George
the Third, Chapter 134, of the Act of the 2nd
and 3rd years ofl Her late Majesty Queen
Victoria, Chapter 49, and of the Act of the
I9th and 20th years of Her said late Majesty,
Chapter 55, duly prepared, and laid before His
Majesty in Council, a Representation, bearing
date the i5th day of June, 1939, in the words
and figures-following, that is to say:—

" We, the 'Ecclesiastical Commissioners for
England, in pursuance of the Act of the sgth
year of His late Majesty King George the Third,
Chapter 134, of the Act of the 2nd and 3rd
years of Her late Majesty Queen Victoria, Chap-
ter 49, and of the Act of the i9th and 20th
years.of Her said late Majesty, Chapter 55,
have prepared, and now humbly lay before
Your Majesty in Council, the following Repre-
sentation as to the assignment of a District

Chapelry to the consecrated Church of Saint
Wilfrid, Halton, Leeds, situate in the Parish, of
Whitkirk, in the County of York and in the
Diocese of Ripon: .• t,.

" Whereas it appears to us to be expedient
that a District Chapelry should be assigned to
the said Church of Saint Wilfrid, Haltori, Leeds,
•situate as aforesaid:

" Now therefore, wfth the consent of the
Right Reverend Geoffrey, Bishop of Ripon
(testified by his having signed and sealed this
Representation), we, the said Ecclesiastical
Commissioners, humbly represent, that it
would, in our opinion, be expedient that all that
part of the said" Parish of Whitkirk which is
described in the Schedule hereunder written,
all which part, together with the boundaries
thereof, is delineated and set forth on the map
or plan hereunto annexed, should be assigned
as a District Chapelry to the said Church of
Saint Wilfrid, Halton, Leeds, situate as afore^
said, and that the same should be named ' The
District Chapelry of Saint Wilfrid, Halton,
Leeds.'

" And with the like consent of the said
Geoffrey, Bishop of Ripon (testified as afore-
said), we, the said Ecclesiastical Commissioners,
further represent, that it appears to us to be
expedient that banns of matrimony should be
published, and that marriages, baptisms,
.churchings, and burials should be solemnized
or performed at the said Church of Saint
Wilfrid, Halton, Leeds, situate as aforesaid,
and that the fees or dues to be received in
respect of the publication of banns and of the
solemnization or performance of marriages,
churchings and burials should be paid and
belong to the minister of the same church for
the time being.

'• THE SCHEDULE to which the foregoing
Representation has reference.

" The District Chapelry of Saint Wilfrid,
Halton, Leeds, being: —

" All that part of the Parish of Whitkirk, in
the County of York and in the Diocese of
Ripon, which is bounded upon the north by the
New Parish of Manston, upon the west by the
New Parish of Saint Philip, Osmondthorpe,
both in the said County and Diocese, and upon
the remaining sides, that is to say, upon the
south and upon the east by an imaginary line
commencing at the point where the boundaries
of the said Parish of Whitkirk, of the said New
Parish of Saint Philip, Osmondthorpe, and of
the New Parish of Saint Hilda, Leeds, in the
said County and Diocese, all meet in the middle
of Halton Moor Road, and extending, thence
eastward along the middle of Halton* Moor
Road for a distance of 66£ chains or thereabouts
to its junction with Templenewsam Road and
Plantation Avenue, and extending thence first
eastward and thence south-eastward along the
middle of Plantation Avenue for a distance of
8£ chains or thereabouts to its junction with
Grove Road, and extending thence southward
along the middle of Grove Road for a distance
of 2 chains or thereabouts to its junction with
the road called Temple Gate, and extending
thence north-eastward along the middle of
Temple Gate for a distance of 27 chains or
thereabouts to its junction with Field End Road,
and extending thence north-westward along the
middle of Field End Road for a distance of 26


