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Re ELIZABETH ANNIE MAGUIRE, Deceased.
Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

ALL persons having any debts, claims or de-
mands against the estate of Elizabeth Annie

•Maguire, late of " Edgemere," Adderstone Cres-
cent, Jesmond, Newcastle-upon-Tyne, Widow, de-
ceased (who died on the 12th day of March, 1985,
and whose Will, with a Codicil, was proved by
Evelyn Maguire and Arthur Eric Lowe, the
executors named therein, on the 15th day of May,
1935, in the Newcastle-upon-Tyne District Pro-
bate Registry), are required to send particulars,
in writing thereof, to me, the undersigned, on or
before the 8th day of April, 1936, after which
date the said executors will proceed to distribute
the assets of the said deceased, having regard
only to the debts, claims and demands of which
they shall then have had notice.—Dated this 4th
day of February, 1936.

JOHN H. SINTON, 4, Queen's Square,
Saville Row, Newcastle-upon-Tyne, Solicitor

(174) for the said Executors.

Re MONTAGU ROWLAND FITZWILLIAM,
Deceased.

Pursuant to Section 27 of the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given that all persons having
claims against the estate of Montagu Row-

land Fitzwilliam, late of " The Flask," 14, Flask
Walk, Hampstead, in the county of Middlesex (who
died on the 5th day of December, 1935, and whose
Will was proved in the Principal Probate Registry
on the 20th day of January, 1936, by Montagu
Rowland Fitzwilliam and Robin Percy Hamp, two
of the executors named in the said Will) are
hereby required to send the particulars thereof, in
writing, to the undersigned, Solicitors for the
executors, on or before the 9th day of April, 1936,
after which date the executors will proceed to dis-
tribute the assets of the deceased, having regard
only to the claims of which they shall have had
notice.—Dated the 5th day of February, 1936.

ROBIN HAMP and GREEN, 19, Bloomsbury
Square, London, W.C.I, Solicitors for the

(158) said Executors.

ELIZABETH STOTESBURY, Deceased.
Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
other persons having claims or demands

against the estate of Elizabeth Stotesbury,
deceased, late of 3, Halstow Road, Greenwich, in
the county of Kent, who died on the 29th day of
October, 1935, and whose Will was proved in the
Principal Probate Registry on the 13th day of
January, 1936, by Joseph William Gleave and
Florence Mary Greed, the executors named in the
said Will, are hereby required to send particulars,
in writing, to the undersigned, on or before the
16th day of April, 1936, after which date the said
executors will proceed to distribute the assets of
the deceased among the persons entitled thereto,
having regard only to the claims or demands of
which the said executors shall then have had
notice.—Dated this 3rd day of February, 1936.

PONTIFEX PITT and CO., 16, St. Andrew
Street, Holborn Circus, E.G.4, Solicitors

(152) for the Executors.

HENRY ADAMS, Deceased.
Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925 (Section 27).

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
other persons having any claims or demands

against the estate of Henry Adams, late of " The
Cedars," 49, Brockley View, Forest Hill, in the
county of London, Retired Consulting Engineer,
who died on the 13th day of August, 1935, and
to whose estate letters of administration (with
Will annexed), were granted on the 27th day of
January, 1936, by the Principal Registry of the
Probate Division of His Majesty's High Court of
Justice to Barclays Bank Limited, the adminis-
trator, are hereby reqtiired to send particulars
thereof, in writing, to the Trustee Department,
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Barclays Bank Limited, at 37, King William
Street, E.C.4, or to the undersigned, on or before
the 7th day of April, 1936, after w.hich date.the
said administrator will proceed to distribute the
assets of the said deceased amongst the persons
entitled thereto, having regard only to .the claims
or demands then notified, and will not be liable
for the assets of the deceased, or any part thereof,
so distributed, to any persons of whose claims or
demands they shall not then have had nptice.—
Dated this 7th'day of February, 1936.

BLOSSE R. ARMSTRONG and CO., Bank
Chambers, Forest Hill, -S.E.23, Solicitors,

(153) for the Administrator.

Re IDA KATE HEAD,. Deceased,
Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors arid
other persons having any debts, claims or

demands against the estate of .Ida Kate Head,
Jate of No. 15, Cambridge Road, and formerly of
No. 14. Nichols Road, in the county borough of
Southampton, deceased (who died on the eleventh
day of _ December, one thousand nine hundred
and thirty-five, and whose Will was proved in
the Principal Registry of the Probate Division of
His Majesty's High Court of Justice on the
twenty-seventh day of January, one thousand nine
hundred and thirty-six, by Midland Bank Executor
and Trustee Company Limited, the executor there-
in named), are hereby required to send in the-par-
ticulars of their debts, claims or demands to us,
the undersigned, the Solicitors for the said execu-
tor, on or before the eighth day _ of April, one
thousand nine hundred and thirty-six, after which
date the said executor will proceed to distribute
the assets of the said deceased among the persons
entitled thereto, having regard only to the claims
and demands of which it shall then have had
notice; and it will not be liable for the assets of
the said deceased, or any part thereof, so dis-
tributed, to any person or persons of whose- debts,
claims or demands it shall not then have had
notice.—Dated this 7th day of February, 1936..,

HEPHERD WINSTANLEY and PUGH,
5, 6^and 7, Albion Terrace, Southampton,

(173) Solicitors for the said Executor.

Re EDITH ANNE GREGORY, Deceased.
Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925. .

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
others having any claims against the estate

of Edith Anne Gregory, late of No. 36, Waterloo
Street, in the county borough of Swansea, Con-
fectioner (who died on the 31st day of March,
1935), are hereby required to send particulars
thereof, in writing, to the undersigned, before
the 10th day of April, 1936. after which date the
assets of the said deceased will be distributed
amongst the persons entitled thereto, having re-
gard only to the claims of which notice has been
received.—Dated this 5th day of February, 1936.

T. R. HARRIS, Angel Chambers, York
Street, Swansea, Solicitor for the Admin-

(092) istrator.

Re Dr. WALTER FRANCIS MURPHY,
Deceased.

Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given, that all creditors and'
other persons having any debts, claims or

demands against the estate of Walter Francis
Murphy, late of 39, Holderness Road, Kingston-
upon-Hull, in the county of York, Medical Prac-
titioner, deceased (who died on the 16th day of
November, 1935, and whose Will was proved in
the Principal Registry of the Probate Division
of His Majesty's High Court of Justice on the
30th day of January, 1936, by Midland Bank
Executor and Trustee Company Limited, the
executor therein named), are hereby required to
send in the particulars of their debts, claims or
demands to us, the undersigned, the Solicitors for
the said executor, on or before the eleventh day
of April, 1936, after which date the said executor
will proceed to distribute the assets of the said


