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Mis. SARAH JANE PARRY, Deceased.
Pursuant to tlie Trustee Act, 1925 (Section 27).

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
other persons having any claims or demands

against the estate of Mrs. Sarah Jane Parry, late
of 36, Redhill Street, Albany Street, N.W., in the
county of London, who died on the 23rd day of
October, 1935, and whose Will was proved in the
Principal Registry of the Probate Division of
His Majesty's High Court of Justice on the 25th
day of November, 1935, by Barclays Bank
Limited, the executor therein named, are hereby
required to send particulars thereof, in writing,
to the Trustee Department, Barclays Bank
Limited, 27, Regent Street, S.W.I, or to the
undersigned, on or before the 6th day of Feb-
ruary, 1936, after which date the said executor
will proceed to distribute the assets of the said
deceased amongst the persons entitled thereto,
having regard only to the claims or demands then
notified; and will not be liable for the assets of
the deceased, or any part thereof, so distributed,
to any persons of whose claims or demands they
shall not then have had notice.—Dated this 27th
day of November, 1935.

B. H. SILVERSTONE and CO., 69, Park
Street, Camden Town, N.W.I, Solicitors

(096) for the said Executor.

Re GEORGE SERCOMBE DAYMOND,
Deceased.

Pursuant to Section 27 of the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given that all persons having
any debts, claims or demands against the

estate of George Sercombe Daymond, late of 9,
Heavitree Road, Sxeter. in the county of Devon,
who died on the 27th day of July, 1935, and to
whose estate letters of administration were
granted by the Exeter District Probate Registry
on the 3rd day of October, 1935, to William
Daymond, are hereby requested to send notice
thereof, in writing, to us, the undersigned, as
Solicitors for the said administrator, on or before
the thirty-first day of January, 1936, after which
date the said administrator will proceed to dis-
tribute the assets of the said deceased amongst
the persons entitled thereto, having regard only
t-> the claims or demands then notified; and will
not be liable for the assets of the deceased, or
any part thereof, so distributed, to any persons
of whose claims or demands they shall not then
have had notice.—Dated this 27th day of Novem-
ber, 1935.

CROS8E and CROSSE, 4, Bedford Circus,
Exeter, Solicitors for the said Administra-

(023) tor.

FRANCES AGNES RIVES, Deceased.
Pursuant to the Statute 15 Geo. V, c. 19.

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
other persons having any debts, claims or

demands against the estate of Frances Agnes
Rives, late of Shenstone House, Sunninghill, in
the county of Berks, England, and of the city of
Newport, Rhode Island, United States of America
(who died on the third day of October, one
thousand nine hundred and thirty-five, and to
whose estate letters of administration, with the
Will and Codicil annexed, were granted to
Elizabeth Charlotte Post, one of the residuary
legatees therein named, in the Principal Registry
of the Probate Division of His Majesty's High
Court of Justice on the twenty-sixth day of
November, one thousand nine hundred and thirty-
five), are hereby required to send particulars, in
writing, of thsir debts, claims or demands to us,
the undersigned, as Solicitors to the said ad-
ministratrix, on or before the twenty-eighth day
of February, one thousand nine hundred and
thirty-six; and notice is hereby given that at the
expiration of that time the said administratrix
will proceed to distribute the assets of the said
testatrix among the .parties entitled thereto, hav-
ing regard only to the debts, claims and demands
of which she shall then have had notice; and that
She will not be liable for the assets, or any part
thereof, so distributed, to any person or persons
of whose debt, claim or demand she shall not

then have had notice.—Dated this 30th day of
November, one thousand nine hundred and thirty-
five.

STIBBARD, GIBSON and CO., 21, Leaden-
hall Street, London, E.C.3, Solicitors to the

(185) said Administratrix.

JAMES MoDOUGALL, Deceased.
Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
others having any claim against the estate

of James McDougall, late of Glenelly, Liverpool
Road, Maghull,. in the county of Lancaster, who
died on the 25th day of May. 1935, and letters of
administration, with the Will annexed, to whose
estate were granted on the 27th day of November,
1935, out of the Principal Probate Registry to
Mary Mitchell Robertson McDougall and Isabella
Dick McDougall, are hereby'required to send par-
ticulars thereof, in writing, to the undersigued
Solicitors, on or before the 10th day of February,
1936, after which date the said administratrices
will proceed to distribute the assets of the de-
ceased among the persons entitled thereto, having
regard only to the claims of which they shall then
have had notice; and will not be liable for the
assets of the deceased, or any part thereof, so
distributed, to any person or persons of whose
claims or demands they shall not then have had
notice.—Dated this 29th day of November, 1935.

PERCY HUGHES and ROBERTS, 9, Hamil-
ton Street, Birkenhead, Solicitors to the

(123) said Administratrices.

Re CHARLES JOSEPH BROADBENT,
Deceased.

Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

MOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
other persons having any debts, claims or

demands against the estate of Charles Joseph
Broadbent, late of Woodside, South Ascot, in the
county of Berks, deceased (who died on the 17th
day of September,1935, and whose Will was proved
in the Principal Registry of the Probate Division
of His Majesty's High Court of Justice on the
25th day of October, 1935, by Harold Ralph
Broadbent and Ferdinand Augustus von Sobbe,
the executors therein named), are hereby required
to send in the particulars of their debts, claims
or demands to us, the undersigned, the Solicitors
for the said executors, on or before the 7th day
of February, 1936, after which date the said
executors will proceed to distribute the assets of
the said deceased amongst the persons entitled
thereto, having regard only to the claims and
demands of which they shall then have had notice;
and they will not be liable for the assets of the
said deceased, or any part thereof, so distributed,
to any person or persons of whose debts, claims or
demands they shall not then have 'had notice.—
Dated this 30th day of November, 1935.

HAROLD MICHELMORE and CO., Newton
Abbot, Devon, Solicitors for the said

(124) Executors.

BERNARD FRANK CAHILL, Deceased.
Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given that all persons having
any claims against the estate of Bernard

Frank CahiU, late of 235, West 46th Street, New
York, in the United States of America, Retired
Hotel Proprietor, who died on the 22nd day of
May, 1935, are hereby required to send particu-
lars, in writing, of their claims to us, the under-
signed, on or before the 4th day of February,
1936, after which date the estate will be distri-
buted amongst the parties entitled thereto, hav-
ing regard only to the claims of which notice shall
then have been received.—Dated this 3rd day of
December, 1935.

LINKLATERS and PAINES, 2, Bond Court,
Walbrook, E.C.4, Solicitors for the Chase
National Executors & Trustees Corporation

(184) Limited, the Administrators of the estate.


