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FRIDAY, 4 MARCH, 1921.

At the Court at Buckingliam Palace, the
7th day of February, 1921.

PRESENT,
The KING'S Most Excellent Majesty.

Lord President.
Lord Chamberlain.
Viscount Milner.
Sir Frederick Ponsonby.
Mr. Burdett-Coutts.

WHEREAS by the West Indian Court of
Appeal Act, 1919, it is, amongst other

things, enacted that there shall be a Court of
Appeal, called the West Indian Court of
Appeal, for the Colonies to -which the said Act
applies, that is to say, the Colonies of Trinidad
and Tobago, British Guiana, Barbados, the
Leeward Islands, Grenada, St. Lucia, and St.
Vincent, and any other Colony that may from
time to time be added by Order of His Majesty
in Council to the number of Colonies to which
the said Act applies (hereinafter called " The
Colonies concerned "):

And whereas by the said Act full provision is
made for the constitution of the said Court, and'
it is by the said Act further provided that the
said Court shall have jurisdiction and power
to hear and determine Appeals (including re-

served questions of law) from any of the Courts
of the Colonies concerned, subject .however to
the provisions of the said Act, and to any pro-
vision which may be made by the Legislature of
any of those Colonies as to Appeals from that
Colony and to Rules of Court made under the
said Act:

And whereas the Legislatures of Trinidad
and Tobago, British Guiana, Barbados, the
Leeward' Islands, Grenada, St. Lucia and St.
Vincent have passed enactments making pro-
vision as to appeals to the said Court from the
said Colonies respectively:

And whereas by the. said Act it is further
provided that the process of the Court of Appeal
shall run throughout the Colonies concerned,
and any judgment, decree, or order of the Court
of Appeal shall have full force and' effect in
every such Colony, and shall be executed and
enforced in like manner as if it were an original
judgment, decree, or order of the Court from'
which the Appeal is brought, and, for all pur-
poses of and incidental to the hearing and deter-
mination of any Appeal within its jurisdiction,
the .Court of Appeal shall have all the power,
authority, and jurisdiction vested in the Court
from which the Appeal is brought:

And whereas by the said Act it is further
provided that subject to any provision which


