
28690. 1141

The London Gazette
autfjorttp.

the rate, by Canadian Magazine Post, is a penny for every pound or fraction of a pound.

For Table of Contents, see last page.

FEIDAY, 14 FEBRUARY, 1913.

At the Court at Buckingham Palace, the
llth day of February, 1913.

PRESENT,

The KING'S Most Excellent Majesty in Council.

WHEREAS the Ecclesiastical Commis-
sioners for England have in pursuance

of the Act of the thirty-third ai d thirty-fourth
years of Her late Majesty Queen Victoria,
chapter thirty-nine, tnd of tb.3 Acts therein
mentioned, that is to say, the Act of the third
and fourth years of Her said late Majesty,
chapter one hundred and thirteen, the Act of
the fourth and fifth years of Her said 1 te
Majesty, chapter thirty-nine, and the Act of
the thirty-first and thirty-second years of Her
said late Majesty, chapter ore hundred and
fourteen, duly prepared and laid before His
Majesty in Council a Scheme bearing date the
seventeenth day of October, in the year one
thousand nine hundred and twelve, in the
words and figures following, that is to say: —

"We, the Ecclesiastical Commissioners for
England, in pursuance of .the Act of the
thirty-third and thirty-fourth years of Her
late Majesty Queen Victoria, chapter thirty-
nine, and of the Acts therein mentioned, that
is to say, the Act of the third and fourth
years of Her said late Majesty, chapter one

hundred and thirteen, the Act of the fourth
and fifth years of Her said late Majesty,
chapter thirty-nine, and the Act of the thirty-
first and thirty-second years of Her said late
Majesty, chapter one hundred and fourteen,
have prepared and now humbly lay before
Your Majesty in Council the following Scheme
for effecting a transfer of the ownership of the
advowson or perpetual right of patronage of
and presentation to the Church and Cure of
Silverdale and Knutton Heath (hereinafter
called ' the said Benefice of Silverdale '), in
the County of Stafford, and in the Diocese of
Lichfield.

" Whereas the advowson or perpetual right
of patronage of and presentation to the said
Benefice of Silverdale is vested in the Vicar or
Incumbent for the time being of the Vicarage
of Wolstanton, in the said County of Stafford,
and in the said Diocese of Lichfield.

" And whereas the Reverend Charles James
Winn, Vicar or Incumbent of th°e said Parish
of Wolstanton, is desirous that the whole
advowson or perpetual right of patronage of
and presentation to the said Benefice of Silver-
dale now vested in him as aforesaid as such
Vicar or Incumbent should be transferred to
and be vested in the Honourable and Right
Reverend Augustus, now Bishop of the said
Diocese of Lichfield, and his successors in the
same Bishoprick.


