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Board of Trade (Harbour Department),
London, February 20, 1911.

H. 2379.

The Board of Trade have received, through
the Secretary of State for the Colonies, a copy
of a Telegram, dated 26th January, from the
Officer a'd'ministering the Government of the
Somaliland Protectorate, stating that, in view
of the outbreak of cholera at Hodeida and
Perim, the port of Berbera only will be kept
open for arrivals from infected districts, and
that sanitary convention rules will be enforced.

Board of Trade (Harbour Department),
London, February 20, 1911.

H. 2443.

The Board of Trade have received a copy of
the following Quarantine Notice, dated llth
February, issued by the Government of
Malta: —

GOVERNMENT NOTICE. .

With reference to Government Notice No.
75, of 24th March, 1910, it is hereby notified
that Algiers is no longer regarded as a place
infected with typhus fever, within the meaning
of Article 1 of the Regulations made under the
Fourth Sanitary Ordinance, 1908, and pub-
lished on the 28th August, 1908, as amended
by Government Notices Nos. 199, 214, 243,
290 and 324 of 1910.

By command,

E. M. MEREWETHEK,

Lieutenant-Governor
and Chief Secretary to Government.

Lieut.-Governor's Office,
The Palace, Valletta,

February 11, 1911.

Board of Trade (Harbour Department),
London, February 20, 1911.

H. 2320.

The Board of Trade have received, through
the Secretary of State for Foreign Affairs, a
copy of a Despatch, dated 9th February, from
His Majesty's Minister at Athens, stating that,
by a Royal Decree, dated the 20th January
last, medical inspection has been imposed as a
sanitary precaution against cholera on arrivals
from Suez and Beyrouth, while pilgrims re-
turning from Mecca will be prohibited from
landing at any Greek ports where the vessels
carrying them may happen to touch.
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Board of Trade (Harbour Department),
London,-February 20, 1911.

H. 2381.

The Board of Trade have received, through
the Secretary of State for Foreign Affairs, a
copy of the following Telegram, dated 18th.
February, from His Majesty's Ambassador at
Constantinople: —'' All measures against
Smyrna suppressed.- Last case of cholera
there 7th February."

Board of Trade (Harbour Department),
London, February 20, 1911.

H. 2380.

The Board of Trade have received, through
the Secretary of State for Foreign Affairs, a
copy of the following Notice, dated 6th Feb-
ruary, issued by the Swedish Board of
Trade:—

In compliance with the Royal Order in
Council of June 16th, 1905, the Royal Swedish
Board of Trade declare Manchuria and the
town of Tientsin, in China, infected with
plague; the Government of Cherson and town
of Odessa, in Russia, and the towns of Osaka
and Kobe, in Japan, free from plague: and,
lastly, the provinces of Bari, Foggia and Gir-
genti, in Italy, and the parts of Russia in
Europe that have hitherto been, considered as
infected with cholera with exception of the
Governments of Podolia, Kiev, Ekaterinoslav,
Kasan and Orenburg free from the last named
disease.

In accordance with the notices issued the
following districts and places are considered as
infected:

Wibh plague:
Egypt; Peru; Valparaiso, Antofagasta and

Pisagua, in Chile; the provinces of Hedschas
and Yemen, in Arabia; the Ural and Trans-
caspian districts, in Asia; Afghanistan; the
ports of Schat-el-Arab; British East India;
Rangoon, in British Burma; Manila on Luzon;
the island of Formosa; Hanoi, in Tonkin;
Amoy and Tientsin, in China; Manchuria;
Sydney, Perth, Freraantle and Geraldton, in
Australia; and

With cholera:
The provinces of Lecce and Palermo, in

Italy; .the Governments of Podolia, Kiev,
Ekaterinoslav, Kasan and Orenburg, in
Russia; the ports of the Red Sea; the ports of
British East India; Cochinchina; Tonkin;
China; Morocco and Madeira.

The station of observation and quarantine
is, until further notice, located at Kanso, near
Gothenburg.' A station of observation for
cholera is arranged at Kalraar.

Stockholm, this 6th day of February, 1911.

The Board of Trade hereby give notice, that
they have revoked the Bishop's Stortford Elec-
tric Lighting Order, 1905, as confirmed by the


