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he London

TUESDAY, JANUARY 6,

T the Court at Osborne House, Me r>f
the 30th day of December, 1884. '

PRESENT,
The QUEEN's Most Excellent Majesty in Council.

WHEREAS the Ecclesiastical Commissioners
for England have, in pursuance of the

Act of sixth and seventh years of Her Majesty,
chapter thirty-seven, duly prepared and laid
before Her Majesty in Council a scheme, bearing
date the twentieth day of November, in the year
one thousand eight hundred and eighty-four, in
the words and figures following, that is to say :—

" We the Ecclesiastical Commissioners for
England in pursuance of the Act of the sixth and
seventh year's of Your Majesty chapter thirty-
seven, have prepared and now humbly lay before
Your Majesty in Council the following scheme
for assigning the right of patronage of the district
and future new parish of Saint Barnabas, Kentish
Town, in the county of Middlesex and in the
diocese of London.

u Whereas by an Order of Your Majesty in
Council bearing date the fourth day of February
in the year one thousand eight hundred and
eighty, and published in the London Gazette on
the sixth day of the same month, the said district
of Saint Barnabas Kentish Town, was under
the Act hereinbefore mentioned and under certain
other Acts in the said Order of Your Majesty in
Council mentioned constituted out of the several
parishes of Saint Luke New Kentish Town, of
Kentish Town and of the Holy Trinity Haver-
stock Hill.

*'And whereas under another Order of Your
Majesty in Council bearing date the second day
of February in the year one thousand eight hun-
dred and eighty-four and published in the London
Gazette on the twelfth day of the same month,
the boundaries of the said district of Saint Bar-
nabas, Kentish Town, so constituted as aforesaid,
were altered by the annexation to the same dis-
trict of a certain further portion of the new parish
of Saint Luke, New Kentish Town in the county
and diocese aforesaid.

"And whereas the same district lias not yet
become a new perish under the provisions of the
hereinbefore firstly-mentioned Act.

*lAnd whereas no specific assignment of the
whole or any part of the right of patronage of the
said district of Saint Barnabas Kentish Town, or
of the nomination of the minister thereof, has
been made by any Order of Your Majesty in
Council; and such right of patronage and nomi-

nation has hitherto continued lo be exercised in
accordance with, and to be subject to, the direc-
tions in that behalf which nre contained in the
hereinbefore firstly-mentioned Act as to ca?cs
wherein no such specific assignment of patronage
has been made.

" And whereas by a certain deed, dated thn
twenty-fifth day of June in the year one thousand
eight hundred and eighty-four, to which deed the
Reverend Albert Edward Whish, Clerk in Holy
Orders, the minister cf the said district of Saint
Barnabas Kentish Town, is a party, and we the
Ecclesiastical Commissioners for England arc also
a party, the said Albert Edward Whish has con-
veyed to us certain land, in the same deed de-
scribed, situate within the said district as and for
the site of an intended new church to be called
Saint Barnabas Church Kentish Town ; which
new church when built and approved by us and
consecrated, Avill become and be the church of the
said district, and the same district will thereupon
become and be a new parish.

"•And whereas the value of the said site, so
conveyed to us as aforesaid, is two thousand three
hundred and fifty pounds, as appears by a certain
indenture now in our possession, dated the twenty-
fourth day of June one thousand eight hundred
and eighty-four, and made between the Metropo-
litan Board of Works of the one part and the said
Albert Edward Whish of the other part.

"And whereas in the said deed of conveyance
of th« twenty-fifth day of June one thousand
eight hundred and eighty-four is contained a
recital to the effect that the same cpnveyance was
made on condition that we should as soon as might*
be after the completion thereof recommend to
Your Majesty in Council that (such arrangement
appearing to us to be expedient) the whole right
of patronage of the said district of Saint Barnabas,
Kentish Town, and so soon as such district shall
have become a new parish, then of such now
parish, and the whole right of nomination ami
presentation of the minister of the said district
or (as the. case may be) of the vicar or incum-
bent of the same new parish, should be assigned
in the manner hereinafter rtcommtndei and pro-
posed.

" And whereas under tV circumstances afore-
said, the pecuniary consideration for the said pro-
posed assignment of patronage would be the said
sum of two thousand three hundred and fifty
pounds, being the value of the aaid site as afore-
said, but in addition to the same, and as a further
consideration for such assignment 'we -have with


