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.buried by the person or persons in whose posses-
sion such Sheep or Lambs may be at the time of
death, with their skins and wool on, in pits of not
less than five feet in depth, and the carcases so
buried shall be covered with quicklime.

rv.
All sheds and places whatsoever, and all rail-

way tracks and other vehicles which may or shall
have been used or' occupied by Sheep or Lambs
affected by the said disease, shall forthwith, after
having been so used, be thoroughly cleansed with
water, and immediately afterwards purified with
chloride of lime by the person or persons in pos-
session of such sheds, places^ trucks, and vehicles
respectively.

V.
Every person in possession of any Sheep or

Lambs in or amongst which the said disease shall
manifest itself, shall, upon ascertaining the fact,
forthwith give notice, in writing, of. such fact to
the Chief Constable or Superintendent of Police
of the division of the county aforesaid comprising
the said parish.

VI.
Every person guilty of an offence against this

Order, shall for every such offence incur a penalty
not exceeding twenty pounds, and where any such
offence is committed with respect t,6 more than
four animals a penalty not exceeding five pounds
for each animal may be imposed, instead of the
penalty of twenty pounds; and where any such
offence is committed with reference to any skin,
wool, horns, or hoofs, a further penalty, not ex-
ceeding one pound, shall be imposed for every,
half-ton in weight of such skins, wool, horns, or
hoofs, after the first ton. Provided that the
penalty for one offence shall in no case exceed
twenty"pounds. . ;.

VII.
The Local Authority of the county of Essex,

as defined by chapter 2 of the Acts of the last
session of Parliament, shall superintend the exe-
cution of this Order, and shall cause it to be
published in a newspaper circulating in that part
of the said county which comprises, the parish
aforesaid.

VIII.
And it is further ordered that this Order shall,

continue in force until revoked by the Lords of
the Privy Council.'

Edmund Harrison.

Whitehall, October .24, 1866. ,

The Queen, taking into Her Royal considera-.
tion that upon the decease of Brinsley, fourth
Earl of Lanesborough, without issue, which:
happened on or about the 14th day of June, 1847,;
the title and dignity of Earl of Lanesborough
devolved upon his cousin and heiiy George-John!
Danvers, late Earl of Lanesborough,.as the. eldest
son and heir of Augustus Richard Butler-Danvcrs,
Esquire, commonly called the Honourable Augus-
tus Richard Butler-Danvers (next brother of
Robert Herbert, third Earl of Lanesborough, the
father of the said Brinsley, fourth- Earl of Lanes-;
borough.), who was the second son of Brinsley,
second Earl of Lauesborough, that, according to
the ordinary rules of honour, the sister of the said'
George-John-Danvers, Earl of Lanesborough,;
cannot, enj.py that place and precedence which

would have been due to her in case her said late
father had survived his nephew, the said Brinsley,
fourth Earl of Lanesborough, and had thereby
succeeded to the title and dignity of Earl of
Lanesbprough, Her Majesty hath been graciously
pleased to ordain and declare that Sophia Eliza-
beth .Mary Dumaresq, the widow/and relict -of
Henry Dumaresq, Esquire, Lieutenant-Qolpnel in
the .Army, deceasedj shall, henceforth have, hold,
and enjoy the same title, place; pre-eminence, and
precedence as if her said late father had survived
his nephew Brinsley, fourth Earl of Lanesborough,
and had thereby succeeded, to the. said title--and
dignity of Earl of Lanesborough :
: Her Majesty hath been further pleased to

' command that the said Royal order and.declara-
tion be registered in Her Majesty's ^College of
Arms. ' •

Whitehall, October 24, 1866.

The Queen, taking into Her Royal consideration
that, upon the decease "of George John "Danvers,
fifth Earl of Lanesborough, without issue, oh the
7th day of July last, the title and' dignity of. Earl
of Lanesborough devolved upon his nephew and
heir,' John' Vansittart Darivers,. now "Earl1 of
Lanesborough, as'the eldest son and heir of
Charles Augustus Danyers Butler, Esq., com-
monly called the Honourable Charles Augustus
Danvers Butler (the next surviving brother of
the "said George'John Danvers, late Earl of
Lanesborough), who was the third but second
surviving son of Augustus Richard Butler Danvers,
Esq., commonly called'the Honourable Augus'tus
Richard Butler Danvers, and grandson of Brinsley,
second Earl of Lanesborough, .that,, according to
the ordinary rules of honour, the brother, and
sisters of the said John Vansittart Danvers, "now
Earl" of Lanesborough, 'cannot enjoy that "place
and precedence which would have been due to
them'in case their said late father had survived
his brother,' the said George John Danvers,' Earl
of Lanesbprough, and had thereby succeeded to
the title :ahd dignity of Earl of Lanesborough,
Her. Majesty hath been graciously pleased to
ordain and declare that Charles Henry Dahvers
Butler, Esq., an Ensign in the 9th (East Norfolk)
Regiment of Foot, Fanny Georginaj Wife of
Loftus FitzrWygram, Esq., Barrister-at-Law,
Emily Rosa Danvers Butler and Harriet Eliuza
Danvers Butler, .Spinsters, the only brother j and
sisters of the said John Vansittart Dariveis, how
Earl of Lanesborough, shall henceforth have, hold,
and enjoy the same titles, place, pre-eminence,
and precedence, .as if their sai,d late father liad
survived his brother, George John Danvers, late
Earl of Lanesboroughy and had thereby; succeeded
to the said title and dignity of Earl of Lanes-
borough : - . . . . . '

Her Majesty hath been further .pleased" to
command. that the said Royal .order and declara-
tion 'be registered in .Her" Majesty's College" of
Arms. ' • •• - i

... Crown Office, October 24, 1866., ;

' MEMBER returned to serve in the preserit'
PARLIAMENT. ; ;

County of Tipperary.
The "Honourable Captain Charles' White, of

Woodland Clbnsifla,. in the county of Dublin,
in the room of ,Jphn Blake Dillon, Esq.,
deceased.


