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ton, in the said parish of Youlgreave, and on the
map hereunto annexed, from the close numbered
125% A, on the same maps, and extending thence
westward, northward, and southward along the
middle of such fence, and along the middle of the
fence which divides the close numbered 125% B,
on the same maps from the said close numbered
56% B, and from the close numbered 56% D, on
the said maps, to a point in the middle of the
fence forming the northern boundary of a certain
small inclosure also numbered 125% B, on the
aforesaid maps, and extending thence south-west-
ward along the middle of the last-mentioned fence
to the middle of the road leading from Stanton
Lees aforesaid to Birchover, and extending thence
westward along the middle of such last-mentioned
road to the boundary between the said parishes of
Darley and Youlgreave."

Her Majesty, having taken the said representa-
tion, together with the map thereunto annexed,
into consideration, was pleased, by and with the
adv-ice of Her Privy Council, to approve thereof,
and to order, and is hereby ordered, that the con-
solidated chapelry therein mentioned for the con-
secratcd church of Saint Catherine, situate % at
Rowsley, in the parish of Bakewell, in the county
of Derby, be accordingly formed, and that the
agreement mentioned-in the said representation
with respect to the right of presentation and ap-
pointment of an incumbent or perpetual curate to
serve the said church be carried into effect agree-
ably to the provisions of the said Acts ; and that
the said right of presentation and appointment of
an incumbent or perpetual curate to serve the
said church, shall belong to, and be exercised by,
the Most Noble Charles Cecil John, Duke of
Rutland, his heirs and assigns for ever.

And Her Majesty is further pleased, to direct
that this Order be forthwith registered by the
Registrar of the Diocese of Lichfield.

Arthur Helps.

T the Court at Windsor, the 26th day of
October, i860.

PRESENT,

The QUEEN's Most Excellent Majesty in Council.

WHEREAS the Ecclesiastical Commissioners
for England have, in pursuance • of an

Act of the third and fourth years of Her Majesty,
chapter one hundred and thirteen, duly prepared
and laid before Her Majesty in Council a scheme,
bearing date the twenty-eighth day of June, in
the year one thousand eight hundred and sixty, in
the words following ; that is to say :

" We, the Ecclesiastical Commissioners for
England, in pursuance of the Act of the third and
fourth years of your Majesty, chapter one hun-
dred and thirteen, have prepared and now humbly
lay before your Majesty in Council-the following
scheme for uniting the office of Lecturer of the
parish of Saint Nicholas, in the city of Durham,
with its emoluments and endowments to the
Perpetual Curacy of the same parish, and for
annexing to the said Perpetual Curacy the re-
version of certain lands, tenements, and heredita-
ments now forming part of the emoluments and
endowments of the said office of Lecturer.

" Whereas the perpetual right of patronage,
presentation, or nomination to the said Perpetual
Curacy of the said parish of Saint Nicholas, is

duly vested in the Most Honourable Frances'1

Anne, Dowager Marchioness of Londonderry, as
tenant for life under certain limitations contained
in an indentute of settlement, bearing date the
twenty-ninth day of December, in the year one
thousand eight hundred and forty-two, and the
right of patronage, presentation, or nomination to
the office of Lecturer of the said parish of Saint
Nicholas is duly vested in George Townshend
Fox, Clerk, and the said George Townshend Fox
has been duly nominated and licensed to and is
how the incumbent or perpetual curate of the said
perpetual curacy, and has been duly nominated
and licensed to and now holds the office of
Lecturer aforesaid.. •

" And whereas the emoluments and endowments
of the said office of Lecturer, consist of a stipend
or annual payment of four pounds, charged upon a
messuage or tenement and land situate in or near
the Market Place in the city of Durham, and the
other emoluments and endowments of the said
office of Lecturer consist of the rents and profits
arising from certain lands, tenements, and here-
ditaments comprised in two several indentures of
lease, bearing date respectively the twelfth day of
May, in the year one thousand seven hundred and
ninety-seven, and the eighteenth day of September,
in the year one thousand eight hundred and thirty,
and particularly described in the Schedule here-
unto annexed ;. the-reversion of which lands, tene-
ments, and hereditaments expectant on the deter-
mination of the said indentures of lease of the
twelfth day of May, one thousand seven hundred
and ninety-seven, and the eighteenth day of
September, one thousand eight hundred and
thirty, is now vested in us.

" And whereas the said Frances Anne,. Mar-
chioness of Londonderry, and the said George
Townshend Fox, as such patrons as aforesaid* are
desirous of uniting the said Perpetual Curacy and
office of Lecturer with all emoluments and endow-
ments to the same respectively belonging.

" And whereas we are of opinion that the
arrangements hereinafter1 proposed by us would,
if carried into effect, conduce to the better cure of
souls within the said parish of Saint Nicholas, in
the city of Durham.

" Now, therefore, with the consents of the Right
Reverend Henry Montagu, Bishop of Durham, as
Bishop of the Diocese, of the said Most Honour-
able Frances Anne, Dowager Marchioness of
Londonderry, and the said George Townshend
Fox, Clerk, testified by their having respectively
signed and sealed this scheme, we humbly recom-
mend and propose that, upon and from the day of
the date of the publication in the London Gazette
of any Order of your Majesty in Council ratifying
this scheme, and without any other conveyance or
assurance in the Law, the said office of Lecturer
of the said parish of Saint Nicholas, in the city of
Durham, with all the emoluments and endowments
thereto belonging or in anywise appertaining or
usually heretofore held, used, or enjoyed there-
with, shall be and become forthwith permanently
united to the said Perpetual Curacy of the said
parish of Saint Nicholas, so that the exercise of
the right of patronage, presentation, or nomination
to the said Perpetual Curacy of Saint Nicholas
shall operate as a presentation or nomination to
the said office of Lecturer, and so that the
avoidance, either by death, or resignation, or
otherwise of either one of the said offices of
Lecturer of Saint Nicholas and. Perpetual Curate
of Saint Nicholas shall operate as an avoidance
of the other.

" And we further recommend and propose, that
upon and from the day of the date of the publica-


