
297-2
assignee talting any other proceedings at law or' in equity, f<T
the purpose of setting aside and cancelling the said indenture
ol assignment, -or compounding or submitting any question
relating to the said assignment and property to arbitration ;
and generally to authorise the said assignee to-do all such acts
and things .as he mav consider necessary, for getting in and
winding up the estate of the said insolvent.; and on other
special affairs.

N >TICK is hereby given, that a meeting of the creditors of
•In'tiph Hammersley, late of No. 3, White Friars-street, in the
.ci'y of Coventry, Ribbon-Weaver, an insolvent debtor, who
•was in or ahout the month of December 1835, discharged
from Her Majesty's Gaol of the city of Coventry, under
and by virtue of an Act of Parliament, made and passed
in the seventh year of the reign of His late Majesty King
George the Fourth, intituled '•' An Act to amend and con-
solidate the laws for the Relief of Insolvent Debtors in
England," will he held on Monday the 4th day of December
next, at twelve o'clock at noon precisely, at the office of Mr.
Joseph Clarke, at Ironmonger-row, in the said city of Coventry,

to approve and direct in what manner, and at what pla--1

or places, the real estate of the said insolvent shall be'.sold by
public auction.

NOTICE is hereby given, tha* a meeting of the creditors of
Charles Stark, formerly of W.- te Horse-whar., Citv-road-
basin, Middlesex, Wharfinger '••<) Draler in Salt, then of
No. 28, Nelson street, City-read, and afterwan's of No 70.,
Upper North-place, Gray's-inn-lane, out of business, then of
No. 45. Blackman-street, borough of Southwark, Surrey,
Plumber, Painter, and Glazier, Paper-Hanger, and Builder,
carrying on business in copartnership with William Cation,
under the Gnu of Slark and Catton, and afterwards of the same
place, carrying on business on his own account, and lastly .of
No. 60, Chalton-street, Somers'-town, Middlesex, outjof busi-
ness, an insolvent debtor, will be hidden at the Guildhall
Coffee-house, in King-street, Cheapside, in the city of London,
on Monday the 27th day of November instant, at eleven
o'clock in the forenoon, for the purpose of choosing one or
more assignee or assignees of the estate and effects of the said
insolvent.
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