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SATURDAY, JANUARY 26, 1822.

Great Chamberlain's-Office,
January 26, 1822.

ALL Peers who intend being present at the
meeting of Parliament on the 6th of Febru-

ary next, will receive one ticket of admission for a
Lady to the House of Peers, on application at this
Office, on the 4th of February, before twelve
o'clock at noon.

All Peeresses, on giving notice before twelve
o'clock at noon on the 4th day of February, will
have places reserved for them in the House of
Peers.

No stranger will be admitted, except by a ticket
subscribed by the Deputy Great Chamberlain.

No Lady can be admitted into the body of the
House except in full dress.

The' doors will not be opened before twelve
o'clock, GWYDYR.

Foreign-Office, January 22, 1822.
The King has been pleased to appoint Alexander

Marrack, Esq. to be Consul at St. Ives, for the
Kingdom of Hanover.

*•
Whitehall, Januaiy 19, 1822.

The King has been pleased to give and grant unto
William-Peere Williams, of Hoddesdon, in the
county of Hertford, Esq. Admiral of the Red
Squadron of His Majesty's Fleet, His royal licence
and authority, that he and his issue may, in com-
pliance with a proviso and declaration contained in
the last will and testament of Sambrooke Freeman,
formerly of Fawley Court, in the county of Buck-
ingham, Esq. deceased, bearing date the 1st day of
June J774, have, use, assume, and take upon him-
self and themselves the surname and arms of Free-
man, in addition to the surname and arms of Wil-
liams ; such arms being first duly exemplified ac-
cording to the laws of arms, and recorded in the
Heralds' Office, otherwise His Majesty's said royal
licence and permission to be void and of none
effect:

And also to order, that this^ His Majesty's con^
cession and declaration be registered in His College
of Arms.

Wliitehall, January 25, 1822.

The King has been pleased to give and grant unto
Thomas Forbes, of Burton Crescent, in tbe parish
of St. Pancras and county of Middlesex, Esq His
royal licence and authority, that be and his issue
may, in testimony of his affection and respect to
his maternal uncle,. Charles Bentley, of Woburn-
place, in the parish of St. George, Bloomsbury
Esq. formerly a Member of the Council of Fort
William, in Bengal, and of the Government there
assume and take the surname of Bentley in ad-
dition to and after that of Forbes, and also bear
and use the arms of Bentley, quarterly with those'
of Forbes, together with their respective crests •
the whole according to the laws of arms: '

And also to command, that His Majesty's royal
concession and declaration be recorded in His Ma-
jesty's College of Arms, otherwise to be void and
of none effect.

Whitehall, January 25, 1922.

The King has been pleased to grant the place of
one of the Lords of Cession in Scotland to Wil
Ham Erskine, Esq. Advocate, in the room of
Claude J; Boswell, Esq. resigned.

. The King has also been pleased to appoint James
A. Maconochie, Esq. Advocate, to be Sheriff Depute
of the shires, of Orkney and Zetland, in the room
of William Erskine, Esq. appointed one of the
Lords of Session in Scotland.

The King has also, been pleased to nominate
constitute, and appoint Robert Hamilton, Esn'
Advocate, to be on<? of the Six Ordinary Clerks of
Session in Scotland, in the room of David Hume
Esq. appointed a Baron of the Court of Exchequer!

The King has also been pleased to constitute and
appoint Hector M'Donald Buchanan, Esn (one
of the Principal Clerks of Session), to be Clerk of
the King's Processes in Scotland, in the room of
David Hume, Esq. appointed a Barou of the
Court of Exchequer. v


