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Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985: Section 15(6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

MARGARET ELIZABETH CATCHPOLE

THE Estate of Margaret Elizabeth Catchpole residing at 32
Craigendmuir Street, Glasgow was sequestrated by the Sheriff at
Glasgow on 9th October 1992, and Colin Anthony Fisher Hastings,
Chartered Accountant, 13 Bath Street, Glasgow, G2 1HY has been
appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the sequestrated
estate.

Any creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. Claims should be stated
as at the date of sequestration which was 21st September 1992.

Any creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

Colin A F Hastings
Interim Trustee

Hastings & Co
13 Bath Street
Glasgow G2 1HY
21st October 1992 (145)

Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985: Section 15 (6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

GEORGE CRAIG

THE Estate of George Craig residing at 73 Sedgebank, Lady we 11,
Livingston, West Lothian was sequestrated by the Sheriff at
Linlithgow on 14th October 1992 and John Dickson Laurie,
Chartered Accountant, Erskine House, 68-73 Queen Street,
Edinburgh, EH2 4NH, has been appointed by the Court to act as
interim trustee on the sequestrated estate.

Any creditor of the debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the interim trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, creditors should note that the date of
sequestration is 21st September 1992.

Any creditor known to the interim trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory meeting of creditors to elect a
permanent trustee.

J D Laurie
Interim Trustee

Cork Gully
Erskine House
68-73 Queen Street
Edinburgh EH2 4NH
19th October 1992 (63)

Bankruptcy Act (Scotland) 1985: Section 15 (6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

MAGNUS MATHIESON CRAWFORD

THE Estate of Magnus Mathieson Crawford residing at 12/5 Pirrie
Street, Leith, Edinburgh was sequestrated by the Sheriff at
Edinburgh on 12th October 1992 and John Dickson Laurie,
Chartered Accountant, Erskine House, 68-73 Queen Street,
Edinburgh, EH2 4NH, has been appointed by the Court to act as
interim trustee on the sequestrated Estate.

Any creditor of the debtor named above is invited to submit his

statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the interim trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 9th September 1992.

Any creditor known to the interim trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the statutory meeting of creditors to elect a
permanent trustee.

J D Laurie
Interim Trustee

Cork Gully
Erskine House
68-73 Queen Street
Edinburgh EH2 4NH
16th October 1992 . (19)

Sequestration of the Estate of

JOHN INGLIS STRACHAN CRAYTON

THE Estate of John Inglis Strachan Crayton residing at, 5 Norval
Court, 12 Norval Street, Partick, Gil 7RX was sequestrated by the
Sheriff of Glasgow and Strathkelvin at Glasgow on 9th October 1992
and J C J Readman, Chartered Accountant, George House, 50
George Square, Glasgow, G2 1RR has been appointed by the Court
to act as Interim Trustee on the Sequestrated Estate.

Any creditor of the debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
account or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 16th September 1992.

Any creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

J C J Readman
Interim Trustee

Ernst & Young
George House
50 George Square
Glasgow G2 1RR
16th October 1992 (24)

Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985: Section 15(6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

SUSAN DARROCH

THE Estate of Susan Darroch residing at 5 Arnprior Street, Glasgow
was sequestrated by the Sheriff at Glasgow on 9th October 1992, and
Colin Anthony Fisher Hastings, Chartered Accountant, 13 Bath
Street, Glasgow, G2 1HY has been appointed by the Court to act as
Interim Trustee on the sequestrated estate.

Any creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. Claims should be stated
as at the date of sequestration which was 17th September 1992.

Any creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

Colin A F Hastings
Interim Trustee

Hastings & Co
13 Bath Street
Glasgow G2 1HY
20th October 1992 (146)


