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Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985: Section 15 (6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

BRIAN PAUL GEARY

THE Estate of Brian Paul Geary residing at Ardioseph, Buccleuch
Road, Selkirk, was sequestrated by the Sheriff at Selkirk on 23rd
June 1992, and William Thomson Mercer Cleghorn, Chartered
Accountant, Erskine House, 68-73 Queen Street, Edinburgh, EH2
4NH, has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on
the Sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purposes of
formula t ing claims, creditors should note that the date of
sequestration is 26th May 1992.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

W T M Cleghorn
Interim Trustee

Cork Gully
Erskine House
68-73 Queen Street
Edinburgh EH2 4NH
30th June 1992 (25)

Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985: Section 15(6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

BRIAN LAWRENCE GERRARD

THE Estate of Brian Lawrence Gerrard. c/o 11 Lindsay Way,
Knightsridge. Livingston was sequestrated by the Sheriff of Lothian
& Borders at Linlithgow on 24th June 1992, and Matthew Purdon
Henderson. BAcc CA. Kidsons Impey, 23 Queen Street, Edinburgh
EH2 1JX has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee
on the sequestrated estate.

Any creditor of the debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee.

Please note that the date of sequestration for creditors claims was
4th June 1992.

Any creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

M P Henderson
Interim Trustee

Kidsons Impey
Chartered Accountants
23 Queen Street
Edinburgh EH2 1JX
30th June 1992 (47)

Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985: Section 15(6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

MARGARET HELEN COOK GERRARD

THE Estate of Margaret Helen Cook Gerrard, 10 Tweed Drive,
Craigshill, Livingston was sequestrated by the Sheriff of Lothian &
Borders at Linlithgow on 24th June 1992, and Matthew Purdon
Henderson, BAcc CA, Kidsons Impey, 23 Queen Street, Edinburgh
EH2 1JX has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee
on the sequestrated estate. /

Any creditor of the debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee.

Please note that the date of sequestration for creditors claims was
4th June 1992.

Any creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

M P Henderson
Interim Trustee

Kidsons Impey
Chartered Accountants
23 Queen Street
Edinburgh EH2 1JX
29th June 1992 (48)

Sequestration of the Estate of

ROBERT DONALDSON GIBSON

The Estate of Robert Donaldson Gibson residing at 1 Lome Terrace,
Miller Road, Oban was Sequestrated by the Sheriff at Oban on 1st
July 1992 and Bryan A Jackson, Pannell Kerr Forster, 78 Carlton
Place, Glasgow G5 9TH has been appointed by the Court to act as
Interim Trustee on the Sequestrated Estate.

Any creditor of the debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulat ing claims Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 8th June 1992.

Any creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

Bryan A Jackson
Interim Trustee

Pannell Kerr Forster
78 Carlton Place
Glasgow G5 9TH
2nd July 1992 (170)

Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985: Section 15(6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

JENNIFER HELEN GILL

The Estate of Jennifer Helen Gill residing at 109 Harris Drive,
Tillydrone, Aberdeen was Sequestrated by the Sheriff at Aberdeen
on 1st July 1992 and Peter J Campbell, 38 Albyn Place, Aberdeen
AB9 1 US has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee
on the Sequestrated Estate.

Any creditor of the debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulat ing claims Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 4th June 1992.

Any creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

Peter J Campbell
Interim Trustee

Pannell Kerr Forster
38 Albyn Place
Aberdeen AB91 US
3rd July 1992 (164)


