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Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985 : Section 15(6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

HENRIETTA FORD

THE Estate of Henrietta Ford, 105 Braemar Drive, Falkirk was
Sequestrated by the Sheriff of Tayside Central and Fife at Falkirk on
14th August 1991 and Nicholas Robinson, Kidsons Impey,
Breckenridge House, 274 Sauchiehall Street, Glasgow has been
appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the Sequestrated
Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. Please note that the date
of Sequestration for Creditors' claims was llth July 1991.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

Nicholas Robinson CA
Interim Trustee

Kidsons Impey
Breckenridge House
274 Sauchiehall Street
Glasgow G2 3EH

28th August 1991 (72)

Sequestration of the Estate of

GEORGE GIBBINS

THE Estate of George Gibbins, having a place of business and
carrying on business at 128A New Street, Musselburgh, East Lothian
EH21 6BY was Sequestrated by the Sheriff of Lothian and Borders at
Haddington on 20th August 1991 and Ian Scott Murdoch, Chartered
Accountant, 33/34 Charlotte Square, Edinburgh EH2 4HF has been
appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the Sequestrated
Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 1st August 1991.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

IS Murdoch
Interim Trustee

KPMG Peat Marwick McLintock
33/34 Charlotte Square
Edinburgh EH2 4HF (83)

formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 1st August 1991 (date of court order granting warrant
to cite).

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

Graham Ritchie
Interim Trustee

Ernst & Young
17 Abercromby Place
Edinburgh EH3 6LT

28th August 1991 (33)

Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985 : Section 15(6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

DAVID HUTTON HAMILTON SNR.

THE Estate of David Hutton Hamilton Snr residing at 96 Park Road,
Kirkcaldy was Sequestrated by the Sheriff at Kirkcaldy on 28th
August 1991 and John Dickson Laurie, Chartered Accountant,
Erskine House, 68-73 Queen Street, Edinburgh EH2 4NH, has been
appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the Sequestrated
Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 6th August 1991.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

JD Laurie
Interim Trustee

Cork Gully
Erskine House
68-73 Queen Street
Edinburgh EH2 4NH

30th August 1991 (74)

Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985 : Section 15(6)

Sequestration of

ELIZABETH MARGARET GIBSON

THE Estate of Elizabeth Margaret Gibson, residing at 79A Hercus
Loan, Musselburgh, Midlothian, was Sequestrated by the Sheriff at
Haddington on 20th August 1991 and Graham Ritchie, Chartered
Accountant, 17 Abercromby Place, Edinburgh EH3 6LT has been
appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the Sequestrated
Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of 30th August 1991

Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985 : Section 15(6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

IAN HEDLEY

THE Estate of Ian Hedley, t/a Grouse and Trout Hotel, Flichity, Farr,
Inverness IV! 2XE was Sequestrated by the Sheriff at Inverness on
15th August 1991 and Peter James Campbell, Pannell Kerr Forster, 38
Albyn Place, Aberdeen AB91US has been appointed by the Court to
act as Interim Trustee on the Sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form, with any supporting
accounts or vouchers, to the Interim Trustee. For the purposes of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration was 3rd July 1991.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

PJCampbell
Interim Trustee

(60)


