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Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 1st November, 1990.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

Peter C Taylor,
Interim Trustee.

29th November, 1990. (55)

Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985: Section 15(6)

Sequestration of the Estate of

SHIRLEY ANN ARMSTRONG

THE Estate of Shirley Ann Armstrong residing at 1 Forthview
Crescent, Wallyford, East Lothian was Sequestrated by the Sheriff at
Haddington on 20th November 1990 and John Dickson Laurie,
Chartered Accountant, 76 George Street, Edinburgh EH2 3BU has
been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the
Sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 2nd November 1990.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

J D Laurie,
Interim Trustee.

Cork Gully,
76 George Street,
Edinburgh EH2 3BU.

30th November 1990. (95)

Sequestration of the Estate of

SHIRLEY ANNE LOGAN

THE Estate of Shirley Anne Logan, residing at 36 Beech Avenue,
Beith, Ayrshire was Sequestrated by the Sheriff at North Strathclyde
at Kilmarnock on 28th November 1990 and J C J Readman,
Chartered Accountant, George House, 50 George Square, Glasgow
G21RR has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on
the Sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 31st October 1990.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

J CJ Readman,
Interim Trustee.

Ernst & Young,
George House,
50 George Square,
Glasgow G2 1RR.

29th November 1990.

Sequestration of the Estate of

STANLEY KEITH BAGSHAW

THE Estate of Stanley Keith Bagshaw residing at Farmhouse, Newton
of Dalvey, By Forres was Sequestrated by the Sheriff of Grampian,
Highland and Islands at Elgin on 12th November 1990 and W. AD.
Macphail, Chartered Accountant, 7 Commerce Street, Elgin IV30
IBS has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the
Sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 23rd October 1990.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

W.A.D. Macphail,
Interim Trustee.

W.D. Johnston & Carmichael,
7 Commerce Street,
Elgin IV30 IBS. ' (35)

Sequestration of the Estate of

STEPHEN ALAN JONES

THE Estate of Stephen Alan Jones residing at 7 Greenhill Road,
Bridge of Dee, Castle Douglas was Sequestrated by the Sheriff of
South Strathclyde Dumfries and Galloway at Kirkcudbright and
Border on 22nd November 1990 and John Charles Jeffrey Readman,
Chartered Accountant, George House, 50 George Square, Glasgow
G21RR has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on
the Sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 1st November 1990.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

J CJ'Readman,
Interim Trustee.

Ernst & Young,
George House,
50 George Square,
Glasgow G2 1RR.

Date: 27th November 1990. (24)

Sequestration of the Estate of

STEWART LOGAN

THE Estate of Stewart Logan, residing at 36 Beech Avenue, Beith,
Ayrshire was Sequestrated by the Sheriff of North Strathclyde at
Kilmarnock on 28th November 1990 and J C J Readman, Chartered
Accountant, George House, 50 George Square, Glasgow G2 1RR
has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the
Sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 31st October 1990.

(72)


